
The steps Argentina and Brazil have taken to 
allow full inspection of their nuclear activities and 

-their decision to give effect to the Treaty of 
Tlatelolco and to consider signing the comprehen-
sive safeguards agreement with the IAEA, will be 
conducive to cooperation in this sphere as well. 

10. Drugs 

Through our initiatives of recent years we have 
considerably strengthened international coopera-
tion to combat drug trafficldng. Meanwhile well 
over twenty countries, as well as the European 
Community and various international organiza-
tions, including the UN International Drug Con-
trol Programme, are involved in the work of the 
Financial Action Task Force to investigate the 
laundering of drug money, and of the Chemical 
Action Task Force to prevent chemicals being 
diverted to the illicit manufacture of drugs. The 
fight against drugs remains a major challenge. In 
order to meet this challenge effectively we shall 
continue our efforts to achieve broad international 
cooperation. In this context we attach special 
importance to the role of the United Nations, 
especially its Drug Control Programme. 

11. Terrorism 

We condemn terrorism in all its forms and reaf-
firm our resolve to cooperate in combatting it. We 
call upon all countries involved to renounce sup-
port for terrorism, including financial support, 
and to take effective action to deny the use of 
their territory to terrorist organizations. 

We denounce equally strongly the taking of hos-
tages. We welcome the rec-ent release of two hos-
tages in Lebanon. We call again for the immediate 
and unconditional release of all hostages who 
may still be held and for an accounting for all 
persons taken hostages who may have died while 
being held. 

We underline the need for Libya to comply with 
Security Council Resolutions 731 and 748 
promptly and fully. We call upon all countries to 
enforce rigorously the sanctions against Libya so 
that those responsible for the bombings of PA 103 
and UTA 772 may be brought to justice and 
Libya's support for terrorism is ended. 

We support the measures of the International 
Civil Aviation Organization aimed at increased 

security in Civil Aviation. We consider the Con-
vention on the Marking of Plastic Explosives for 
the Purpose of Detection to be a significant step 
towards this aim. 

POLITICAL DECLARATION: SHAPING 

THE NEW PARTNERSHIP 

I. 

1. We, the leaders of our seven countries and 
the representatives of the European Community, 
support the democratic revolution which has 
ended the East-West confrontation and has funda-
mentally changed the global political landscape. 
Since we last met, further dramatic changes have 
accelerated progress towards democracy, market-
based economies, and social justice. The way has 
been opened for a new partnership of shared 
responsibilities, not only in Europe which at long 
last is reunited, but also in the Asia-Pacific region 
and elsewhere in the world. We are entering an 
era where confrontation has given way to cooper-
ation. 

2. This new partnership will take many forms. 
The former adversaries of East and West will 
cooperate extensively on economic, political and 
security issues. We look for worldwide develop-
ment of similar patterns of cooperation within 
regions and between regions. As developed coun-
tries, we offer continuing support and assistance 
to developing countries. We believe that transna-
tional problems, in particular the proliferation of 
weapons of mass destruction, can be solved only 
through international cooperation. Partnership 
will flourish, as common values take root, based 
on the principles of political and economic free-
dom, human rights, democracy, justice and the 
rule of law. We believe that political and eco-
nomic freedom are closely linked and mutually 
reinforcing and that, to that end, good governance 
and respect for human rights are important crite-
ria in providing economic assistance. 

3. The countries of Central and Eastern Europe 
and the new states of the former Soviet Union can 
now seize unprecedented opportunities — but 
they also face enormous challenges. We will sup-
port them as they move toward the achievement 
of democratic societies and political and economic 
freedom. We encourage them to create a stable 
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