
Sec 2] INTERPRETATIONS. 5

territorial or local division of any province of Canada, 
the inhabitant.» whereof arc incorporated or have the 
the right of holding property for any purpose ;

(tf) 4 newspaper/ iu the sections of the Act relating to 
defamatory libel, nswn any paper, magazine or peri­
odical containing public news, intelligence or occur­
rences, or any remarks or observations thereon, printed 
for sale and published periodically or in parta or num­
bers, at intervals not exceeding thirty-one days between 
the publication of any two such pa|iers, parts or nuin- 
bers, and also any paper, magazine or periodieal printed 
in order to lie dispersed and made publie, weekly or of- 
tener, or at intervals not exceeding thirty-one days, and 
containing only or principally advertisements ;

(83) ‘nioiit' or ' night time * means the interval be­
tween nine o’clock in the afternoon and six o’clock in 
the forenoon of the following day. and 4 day ' or * day 
time ' includes the interval between six o’clock in the 
forenoon and nine o’clock in the afternoon of the same 
day ;

(24) 4 offensive weapon ' ok ' weapon ’ includes any 
gun or other firearm, or air-gun, or any part thereof, 
or any sword, sword blade, bayonet, pike, pike-head, 
spear, spear-head, dirk, dagger, knife, or other instru­
ment intended for cutting or stabbing, or any metal 
knuckles, or other deadly or dangerous weapon, and any 
instrument or thing intended to lie used as a weapon, 
and all ammunition which may be used with or for any 
weapon ;

(25) 4 Part' means a Part of this Act;
(26) 4 peace officer ' includes a mayor, warden, reeve, 

sheriff, deputy sheriff, sheriff’s officer, and justice of the 
peace, and also the warden, keeper or guard of a peni­
tentiary and the gaoler or keeper of any prison, and any 
police, officer, police constable, bailiff, constable, or other 
person employed for the preservation and maintenance 
of the public peace, or for the service or execution of 
civil process;

(27) ‘ public department ’ includes the Admiralty and 
War Department, and also any public department or


