
The Agc of Bacon.

on a mule, with a crucifix in his band,
bis head and feet barc; his dress was
a long robe, girt with a cord, and a
hermit's cloak of coarsest stuff. e
prcachcd in the puîlpits, on the roads,
in the market places. His cloquence
was that which stirs the he:art of the
people, for it came from his own-
brief, figurative, full of bold apos-
trophes ; it vas mingled with his own
tears, with his own groans; be beat
his breast; the contagion spread
througbout his audience. His preach-
ing appealed to cvery passion--to
valour and to shame, to indignation
and to pity, to the pride of the war-
rior, to the compassion of the man,
to the religion of the Christian, to the
love of the brethren, to the hatred of
the unbeliever, aggravated by his in-
sulting tyranny, to reverence for the
Redeemer, to the desire of expiating
sin, to the hope of eternal life." All
Europe rang with his voice. A Coun-
cil was called at Rome and Clermont,
where Pope Urban delivered a stirring
address to assembled thousands. The
enthusiasm of the multitude was kin-
died, their indignation stirred up, and
trom ten thousand hearts went forth
the cry, " It is the will of God, it is
the will of GodI" A vast and motley
army of men and women is formed,
and with one heart and voice, like a
surging wave, irresistible in its giant
night, they niove to the Holy Land.
After a long and toilsome march of
two years, enduring intense suffering
and encountering fierce armies, the
valls of Jerusalem rise before their

delighted gaze. The Mohammedan
hosts are scattered, and the Crusaders
enter and take possession. During
the two following centuries, six suc-
cessive waves of Crusaders rolled over
Europe, and spent their strength in
defending the holy city, and then
there was a lull. The wild wave of
enthusiasm subsided, and a deep calm
brooded over the face of Europe. In
the history of nations, as in that of

individuals, periods of intense excite-
ment are nostly followed by pcriods
of deep calm. A reaction takes
place ; nature becomes exhaustcd,
and lier strength spent, and it tikcs
some time cre wontcd vigour and
health returns. But the moral effects
of the Crusades upon Europe wcre
marked and abiding. They set in
operation a number of streamis of in-
fluence which contributed, in no snall
degrec, to swell the tide which was to
roll in the Reformation of the future.
They, in the first place. had the effect
of making men more libcral.minded
and cosmopolitan.

There is nothing which contributes
so much to make men narrow-minded
and intolerant, as living for a long
period of time in one place, excluded
from intercourse with their fellows.
Let such men go abroad and mingle-
with their fellows, converse and trade
with them, observe their habits, and
learn their opinions, and the result
ivill be evident. They will become
more liberal-minded and tolerant, their
knowledge will be enlargcd, their
prejudices removed, and by the fric-
tion of mind upon mind, their facul-
tics become sharpened. And such
was the effect produced upon the
Crusader by his journey to the Holy
Land. Before, lie knev little or
nothing of the people of the East.
This pilgrimage to jerusalem brought
him face to face with a new people.
He began to know his fellow-men
better, and to discern more clearly,
beneath all the artificial distinctions of
dress and colour and creed, the beat-
ing human heart-the pledge of our
common humanity. Besides, a spirit
of independence was inspired, liberty
of thought was fostered and grew, and
the chain vhich had been thrown
around him by the Church became-
more and more keenly felt. But
another benefit flowing from the Cru-
sades, was, that a channel was opened
up between the East and the West,
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