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R AILS, STEEL :-Motion (Mr. Blake) for Statement shewing quantity of steel
rails and fastenings bought by Government in 1879, and average price
thereof, quantity already delivered and used, &c.; Amendment proposed by
Mr. Plumb that Statement include quantities of rails and fastenings
purchased in the years 1874-75-76, with price thereof, 64. Further amend-
ment by Sir R. Cartwright that Statement also include quantities cf rails
bought since lst January, 1871, with prices thereof; Amendment to the
amendment agreed to; Amendment, as amended, agreed to ; Main Motion,
as amended, agreed to, 65. See Accounts and Papers, 199.

RAILWAY CoMMISSIoNERS, COURT OF :-See Railways, 6-8.

RrAILWAYS:

1. Standing Committee on Railways, Canals and Telegraph Lines appointed, 11,
37. Members added, 44, 61, 191. Bills referred, 71, 193, &c. REPORTS On
various Bills, 213, 248, 264, 292, 302, 313, 355. Committee report thattbey
have amended the Preamble of a Bill, 264. Recommending that special
Railway Maps be prepared for the use of the Committee, 281. That time
for reception of Reports on Private Bills be extended, 292. That they have
granted more extensive powers to a company than were asked for in their
Petition, 313.

2. Petition of Messrs. Bourgouin & Lamontagno, for Legislation affording them
a remedy to obtain compensation under provision of Railway Acts of 1868
and 1879 ii relation to certain Railways, 59.

3. Petitions praying for passing of an Act to prevent purchasing of passenger
tickets which have been used but not marked, and reselling same at rates
less than proper fare: Canada Central Railway Co., 116; Credit Valley
Railway Co., 78; Grand Trunk Railway Co., 71; Midland Railway Co., 190;
New Brunswick and Canada Railway Co., 151; Northern Railway Co., 166;
Port Dover and Lake Huron Railway Co., 106; St. John and Maine Railway
Co., 172 ; Stratford and Huron Railway Co., 116 ; Whitby, Port Perry and
Lindsay Railway Co., 124.

4. Bill respecting sale of Railway Passenger Tickets (Mr. Kirkpatrick); Order-
ed; Presented, 160.

5. Petition praying that Petition of Grand Trunk Railway Co. in favor of fore-
going Bill may not bo granted, but that said Company may bo compelled to

desist from extortion practised by them on people of Canada, 164.

6. Bill for constituting a Court of Railway Commissioners for Canada, and to

amend the Consolidated Railway Act, 1879 (Mr. McCarthy); Ordered ;
Presented, 69. Motion for second reading; Amendment moved, to postpone
second reading six months; Debate thereon adjourned, 189. Resumed and

further adjourned, 209.

7. Petitions praying that the foregoing Bill may not become law: Albert Rail-

way Co., 106; Canada Central Railway Co., 104; Cobourg, Peterborough &
,Marmora Railway Co., 115; Grand Trunk Railway Co., 84; Great Western

Railway Co., 115; International Railway Co., 116; Lake Simcoe Junction

Railway Co., 164; Massawippi Railway Co., 104; Midland Railway Co., 160;
Mississquoi and Black Rivers Valley Railway Co., 88; Montreal'and Cham-

plain Junction Railway Co., 84; Montreal, Portland and Boston Railway
Co., 104; New Brunswick and Canada Railway Co., 151; Northern Railway
Co., 106; Nova Scotia, Nictaux and Atlantic Central Railway Co., 151;


