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services necessary in an urban environment. Much prog-
ress has already been attained in these areas, but much
more remains to be done. To solve the problems will
require an ever-increasing share of the nation's financial
resources; not to solve them, to permit unmanaged
growth, would result in an unacceptable drain on the
nation's human resources. To foster coordination of the
activities of all levels of government, and to contribute to
sound urban growth and development, the Government
proposes the re-organization of its urban activities under
the direction of a Minister of State for Urban Affairs and
Housing. The Government seeks, by making rational its
efforts in these fields, and through consultation with
those most directly concerned, to help Canadians reach
and implement the decisions that will determine their
urban future.

There exists in Canada a great wealth of untapped and
uncoordinated scientific talent and experience not now
adequately utilized in the quest for solutions to our
modern problems. In order to serve better the industrial
and technological sectors of our economy, as wel as
Canada at large, a programme will be introduced to
gather and focus these sometimes divergent and competi-
tive scientific resources. In this respect the Government
will consider with care measures recommended by the
Senate Committee on Science Policy and the Science
Council of Canada.

A society is said to be judged best by the compassion
and the fairness with which it treats those of its mem-
bers who breach or are accused of breaching the norms
of conduct which it establishes for itself. The Canadian
record in this respect is of a high standard, but not so
high that it can withstand ail criticism. You will be
asked, therefore, to consider further measures intended
to continue the reform of the law in these areas. Legisla-
tion has been prepared which deals with bail and pre-tri-
al detention, and with the treatment of young offenders.

Norms of conduct are never static, however, and cer-
tainly not at present. A society which cherishes the con-
cept of freedom of individual rights must be prepared
constantly to assess the effect and extent of changing
attitudes, no matter how distressing or disturbing the
re-evaluation may be to some persons. Previously
accepted postures are under attack in Canada and
require study in several areas. The Government accepts
its responsibility in this process. The report of the Com-
mission of Inquiry into the Non-Medical Use of Drugs,
expected within the next few months, will require care-
ful study and discussion. The Government proposes to
make time available during this session for discussion of
stiil another controversial issue. It proposes a special
debate on abortion.

To ignore the undoubted widespread challenges to pres-
ent laws in these fields would be dishonest. You will be
invited, therefore, to participate, in the examination of
these important questions. You will be asked as well to
give consideration to the report of the Royal Commission
on the Status of Women when once this is received.

Fortunately, not ail aspects of Canadian life are subject
to such differences of opinion, and the need for legisla-
tion in certain sectors is widely recognized. Two such
sectors, immense in size and largely overlapping, are
those of the consumer and the employee. Every Canadian
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is a consumer of goods and services, millions of Canadi-
ans are employees. To face today's competitive marketing
system, the consumer requires protection in a number of
respects. Measures will be introduced, therefore, to pro-
tect Canadians more adequately from the results of com-
bines, mergers and unfair trade practices, to regulate the
labelling and packaging of consumer goods, and to pro-
tect further the users of consumer credit.

Because the Canadian work force is growing in size
and sophistication, and operating within an increasingly
integrated industrial environment, present measures must
be amended to meet changing social requirements. You
will be asked, therefore, to approve a revised legal
frame-work for labour-management relations and a new
set of labour standards for industries within federal
jurisdiction. Sweeping changes in the field of unemploy-
ment insurance will be proposed in a bill designed to
widen considerably both the benefits offered and the
persons who are qualified to take advantage of them.
These measures will make more rational and more fair
the assistance available to those temporarily without
employment. The legislation is a product of the careful
study of this subject tabled in Parliament last session in
the form of a white paper.

A number of other studies of this same nature have
been underway in past months as well. These reflect
Government planning for the Canada of the seventies.
Parliament will be invited to examine in this session a
number of white papers in such diverse fields as com-
munications, citizenship, immigration, national defence,
and income security policy.

The Government is pleased at the widespread and
largely constructive public response to its invitation to
comment upon the proposais contained in its white paper
on tax reform. The views of those who have participated
in this exercise are being examined and carefully consid-
ered, as will those of the two Parliamentary Committees.
Thereafter, legislation will be introduced incorporating
policies designed to make more equitable the economic
burden shared by our fellow dwellers in this complex
and varied land. These taxation measures are part of the
Government's pledge to utilize the wealth of Canada for
the good of all Canadians and not just for those fortunate
enough to be shielded by the protective apparatus of
giant corporations, alert professional organizations or
powerful labour unions.

It remains the goal of the Government to be concerned
with the production of wealth. It also remains the goal of
the Government that Canadians be given the opportunity
to enjoy that wealth. Income security programmes offer
one means by which this latter goal can be attained. To
this end legislation will be introduced.

All our efforts for a stable prosperity and for a humane
community will be of little value to us, however, if we do
not quickly and determinedly grapple with the threat to
our well-being and the well-being of future generations
of Canadians which is represented by environmental pol-
lution. Pollution is a many-headed hydra and requires
action in many forms. You will be asked to consider bills
intended to deal with pollution in two of its aspects: in
the ocean and in the atmosphere. More pressing than any
single step or steps, however, is the need to co-ordinate
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