
In-Competition: Unless provided otherwise in the rules of an International Federation or the ruling 
body of the Event in question, “In-Competition " means the period commencing twelve hours 
before a Competition in which the Athlete is scheduled to participate through the end of such 
Competition and the Sample collection process related to such Competition.

[Comment: An International Federation or ruling body for an Event may establish an 
“In-Competition ” period that is different than the Event Period.]

International-Level Athlete: Athletes who compete in sport at the international level, as defined 
by each International Federation, consistent with the International Standard for Testing and 
Investigations.

[Comment: Consistent with the International Standard for Testing and Investigations, the 
International Federation is free to determine the criteria it will use to classify Athletes as 
International-Level Athletes, e.g., by ranking, by participation in particular International Events, 
by type of license, etc. However, it must publish those criteria in clear and concise form, so that 
Athletes are able to ascertain quickly and easily when they will become classified as 
International-Level Athletes. For example, if the criteria include participation in certain 
International Events, then the International Federation must publish a list of those International 
Events.]

Major Event Organizations: The continental associations of National Olympic Committees and 
other international multi-sport organizations that function as the ruling body for any continental, 
regional or other International Event.

National Anti-Doping Organization: The entity (ies) designated by each country as possessing the 
primary authority and responsibility to adopt and implement anti-doping rules, direct the 
collection of Samples, the management of test results, and the conduct of hearings at the national 
level. If this designation has not been made by the competent public authority!ies), the entity shall 
be the country’s National Olympic Committee or its designee.

National-Level Athlete: Athletes who compete in sport at the national level, as defined by each 
National Anti-Doping Organization, consistent with the International Standard for Testing and 
Investigations.
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