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proposition. Presumably this matter has been included in the
Criminal Code for ail these years because socicty has feit there
is somcthing wrong with the practice. It had to be illegal
because it presumably creates hurt and damage to society. 1
would like to point out, Mr. Speaker, that making it legal does
flot make it right. Wbilc what was illegal now becomes legal;
what was hurtful stili rernains hurtful.

We have to ask ourselves what is wrong with the entire
proposition. First of ail, garnbling always depends for its
success on the fact that most people who participate will lose.
The whole system will fail if you have more winners than
losers. Gambling is flot going to be "a successful" business
venture if there are more winncrs than losers. As other Mcm-
bers have pointed out, there is sornething rnorally wrong with
governmcnt institutionalizing a system which requires more
losers than winncrs. There is something rnoraliy wrong with a
goverriment which wants to profit on thc backs of losers. This
is reprehensible and diametrically opposed to the Canadian
way of life and the Canadian code of morality.

lt is wrong also because it violates patternis of human
satisfaction. 1 thînk ail of us will agree that man is inherently
creative, that crcativity is mnan's grcatest instinct. 1 will flot
deny that ail of us get a temporary kick out of a bonanza. We
ail enjoy a windfall. But that is somcthing quite différent from
getting satisfaction.

Now, Mr. Speaker, if it is in our nature to be creative, then
it scems to me that for us to bc happy wc have to have satisfac-
tion rather than simpiy a kick. The only way we can do that is
by satisfying our creative instinct, by unleashing our crcativity.
Therefore, man's greatest satisfaction cornes frorn accomplish-
ment, flot frorn bonanzas. Inherent in this proposai is the
attempt to enhance the desire within man to short-circuit the
path to satisfaction. That is a disservice to the Canadian
people and a denial of the hurnan experience.

What we will end up with, Mr. Speaker, is the Governrnent
promoting illusions of instant wealth which will rob people of
the inherent human satisfaction expcrienced when wc create
something with our own hands. Wc wili have a population
directed more and more towards the illusion of instant weaith,
when of course the fact is that life is flot that way. Most of the
time we have to work for what we get. I point to the advertise-
ments for Super-Loto. They show the symbols of wealth,
obviously successful people lounging around the yacht club.
The obviously wealthy people corne in and sit at a table and
one successful person says to the other: "Textiles? Shipbuild-
ing?" The answer is: "No, Loto Can". You do flot have to
invest any more. You do not have to work any more. You do
not have to dcvclop your ingenuity any more. You do flot have
to take risks any more. Just buy a ticket to instant wealth, the
Icisure class and to acccptability.

We arc building these illusions of instant success. Wc are
saying to the unemployed that the way to get wealthy is to buy
tickets. We used to say to the young people of Canada that if
you will begin early and invest, you can buiid security. But we
are now saying to people that if they will put aside a few bucks
and buy a ticket on Loto Select, a sports pool or Loto Canada,
they will have a chance of instant wealth. But we neyer give
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the odds. We neyer say it is a million to one, or, as a speaker
pointed out yesterday, that you have more chance of being hit
by iightning than of winning a large cash prize.

1 remember years ago, Mr. Speaker, whcn 1 worked at
Fraser Milîs as a teenager, that 1 worked alongside a young
man of my age at the time, 18 or 19 years old. He had been
working at the miii for some years and when he was 19 years
oid he was building his third house. 1 imagine that by today he
is probably quite successful, but rny friends on the left will ask
how he got so wealthy, he does flot deserve ail that money.
Well, the fact is he started early and he saved and he worked.
Through the systern which the Government wants to introduce
right now, it wants to undercut that kind of ethic, that kind of
working for success. It wants instant solutions. The program is
wrong because it builds an unhealthy world of fantasy and
illusion.
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Third, it is wrong because it overtaxes low income groups.
We see the duplicity of the Government working out programs
to help low income groups, whether through UIC, grants or
any other prograrn-the Government is always on a grant kick
to help low income groups-and at the samne time there is now
a process by which it can take its money away frorn the low
incorne groups, because as other Hon. Members have men-
tioned, statistics regularly show that the loto system is mostly
supported by members of the lower incorne groups in our
society.

1 sc the Minister sitting here, the one who is foisting this
Bill on us. It is instructive to notice that one does not sec Loto
Canada kiosks in the lobbies of banks. One does not sc thern
in the mails right in front of the banks. One does not sec these
kiosks in the glass towcr, high-rise business buildings. Where
does one sec them? One secs thcm directly in front of or
maybe even inside grocery stores or in the shopping mails. The
focus is on impulse buying, flot on invcstment. The focus is on
a sense of imrncdiate gratification rather than on building and
planning one's future. These operations know very weil, and
the Government knows very well, that they will not do vcry
wcll if kiosks are placed in banks or directly in front of banks,
because people who go there are planning. They are flot
looking for instant gratification; they are looking for a return
on investment. They arc looking for work.

The fact that these kiosks are always situatcd where people
are most vuinerable to impulse is prctty wcll an indication of
wherc the success wili lie. The immorality of the whole system
lies in the fact that the Governrnent wants to victirnize the
group that can least afford to be victimized. If the Government
would seli the program to those who made $50,000 a year or
more, then we would say: "Let those people take a risk". But
right now, the Govcrnment is victimizing those who are in the
low incorne groups.

We are now in the dying stages of this session. Perhaps the
fact that the legisiation cornes at the end of this session is
symbolic of the rnorality of the Government. This legisiation is
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