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Cost of Living

I would like to say aiso at this tîme that I arn very giad
that the Minister of Finance (Mr. Turner) is in the House
tonight because, ever since his appointment, ail his fore-
casts have been wrong.
[En glish]

There is one thing, Sir, that a very simple poil across
this country would teach us, and that is that the number
one domestic issue facing Canadians today is infaltion-
mounting prices. We are f aced with a Liberai-Socialist
coalition that just refuses to act. We are faced with a
government that blames everybody but themselves. They
appoint a chairman to some commission, give her $40,000 a
year-which sureiy solves her inflation probiem-and who
does she blame? Aided and abetted by the government, she
blames the people.

I arn going ta talk about another matter. When prices go
up, the Minister of Finance and the Prime Minister (Mr.
Trudeau) blame the provinces. In addition, the Minister of
Finance likes to blarne world conditions. This reminds me,
Mr. Speaker, of the littie kid in school who neyer studied
for his exams and fiunked. But he said, "I'rn ail right
because everyone else fiunked, so that's okay.' I listened
to the hion. member for Don Valley (Mr. Gillies) this
afternoon and I must say it is the height of irresponsibility
on the part of hon. members opposite to prattie day in and
day oui in this House about nonsense to the effect that
sînce the rest of the worid is not doing too weil, we are
okay too; that just because everybody else is flunking, we
have ta flunk too. It is not necessarily true that everybody
else is fiunking. They have an incomes and prices policy in
Australia, and sa far as inflation and rising prices are
concerned, that country has one of the best records in the
world.

* (2030)

How about this continuai comparison with the United
States? It seems absolutely erraneous to me. We will not
necessariiy apply in detail or in general the samne poiicies
as does President Nixon. There is a big argument, and if
the Leader of the NDP (Mr. Lewis) would only listen he
would know that we have said time and time again that
ane of the reasans their contrais at one stage did not work
is that they iifted them too soan.

Conditions today are flot the samne as when they appiied
the controls or lifted them in the United States. I subrnit
to the right hion. Prime Minister and ta the Minister of
Finance that it is a phony, an erroneaus argument and
that he is camparing apples with pears. If the minister
would just throw aside some of those seif satisfied state-
ments and documents with which he presents us all the
tirne, he wouid admit ta us that he is comparing appies
with pears most of the time.

Mr. Turner (Ottawa-Carleton): No, with iemons.

Mr. Grafftey: Why is there a need for a prices and
incarnes policy? I do nat have too much time at my dispos-
ai th is evening, nor do ather members.

Mr. Turner (Ottawa-Carleton): Take ahl the trne you
wan i.

[Mr. Gr afftey.J

Mr. Grafftey: The clacks do flot want the truth. Why is
there a need for a prices and incarnes palicy? Its harmful
effects on the distribution of incarne within the state and
within the worid are evident. I have recited its effects on
people with fixed incomes, on pensioners and farmers. lis
harmful effects on the labour-management bargaining
process and on the pricing mechanisrn of the state are
obviaus. Its potentialiy harrnful effects on a state's trading
policies are obviaus.

I wish the Minister of Finance would stop saying that if
we had prices and incarnes contrais they wouid autamati-
caliy harm aur trading position. They would not, and he
knows it. It is an old-fashioned argument that might have
been applicable 100 years ago, but is certainiy flot appli-
cable in cantemporary conditions. It is a distortion of
economic growth patternis. It has an emotional impact.
Once we know that the inflation psychology is rolling, it
continues ta roll and very few things can stop it. We have
said time and time again that a freeze faiiawed by contrais
is flot the be ahl and end ail, but it is certainiy samething
that deserves on its merits ta be tried.

Mrs. MacInnis (Vancouver Kingsway): It has been
tried in the United States.

Mr. Grafftey: You are prattiing the same nonsense as is
the Minister of Finance. This is flot a comparisan. Infla-
tion has become a psychological, social and politicai prob-
lem and fia wise goverfiment refuses to deai with it as does
this goverfiment. A wise goverfiment cannot ignore exces-
sive inflation as this gaverfiment has.

The only reasnn that we have any measi1res in front of
us here thîs week ta at ieast partially deal with the
problem is the rail strike. Because of this government's
mismanagement of the rail strike, parliarnent was
recaiied. I cannot heip but pay tribute ta an outstandîng
Canadian ai present flot in this House. Under the govern-
ment of the right hon, gentleman ta my right at the tîme
when the han. Michael Starr heid the labour portfolio, we
did nat have rail strikes. They were properiy settled in
those days. Mr. Starr got the parties together. Not once
under the administration of the right hon. member for
Prince Albert (Mr. Diefenbaker) did we have ta recaîl
parîxament.

Sorne hon. Mernbers: Hear, hear!

Mr. Grafftey: But we had to recali pariiameni under the
present Minister of Labour (Mr. Munro) because we had
piecemeal policies-toa iittle taa laie. Then the NDP
became excited. They said that this will be the big chance
ta attack inflation because they had been back to their
ridings for a few weeks and they heard the people talking.
What do we have? We have a few ad hoc, piecemeaj
measures which satisfy the NDP, but they are easiiy satis-
fied by the presenit gaverfiment. They wili soan see, if we
get oui of here and go back ta the people, that what we
have been deaiing with in terms of goverfiment measures
this week and iast week wiii nat satisfy the Canadian
people.

Somne hon. Mernbers: Hear, hear!
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