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RELIGIOUS Il

4ýNNiyr.PsAn MEETINGS.

Of the sixty or seventy Societies
which hold theii Annual Meêtings
duringthe month of May, chiefly in
Exeter Hall, London, ive vili. *enu-
meraté those whicà belong to the
Wesleyan Church.

Missionary Soc-iety.-Thp great
hall wvas crowded . long before the ap-
pointed hour, The platform ivas oc-
cupied by roinisters and ]aymen from
all, parts of the cpuntry, and several
iepresentatives fromn foreign. lands.
An hour was occupieci wvith'* religi-
ous, service,,.which. consisted of sing-
ing four of Charles Westey's stirring
Mîssionary hlymns, and a selection
fromi Mr. Sankey>s most popular
songs. Thus -the Missionary Meet-
ing. wgs precededý by. a good old-
fashion.ed prayer meeting, attended
by more than three th ousandpelrs6ns.
Noý wtonder thatt the, ihole service of
five hours ivasa season .of refreshîng
from the 'presenceof the Lord.

The. receipts -for the year aggr:e-
gated over $920,oQo. The mission-
aries labour in Ireland,, France,
Switzerland, Geirmany,,,Bavaria,,Aus-
tria, Italy, 'Sicily, Ëpaln, 'Portugal,
South and West 'Africa, West Indies,
China, India and -Ceylon,,and vani-
ous -parts, of Polynesia. In all there
are 53 (. missionaries, .11,000 memn-
-bers, and 134,090; scholars. The
meeting issaid -to have'been one of
the most cheering ever lield. Th
Lord Provost of Edinburgh presided,
and speeches of, rare enthusiasm ,ý.d
great powverwere delivered by ,Dr.
Punshon, the Dean of 'Canterbur.y,,
Professor Smnith, M.P., the 1Revs.- 0.
Mcçutchefl, J.ohrn I-1qcheson, John
Bedford, Samuel Coley, and W. 0_.
,Simpson.

Four Anpp!a Sermons -are, preach-
ed, during Uie preceding, .week, iand a

Misin r frajfast'is.ýhIfdon,.Sat-
urday mnrxing, th9çproç,eeds of-vhich
-alwva's, go to thie Çh,îm 1 uson;,.thenýi

on Sabbath, more than two hunlrgd.
sermons are preached in various
London churchies. All the services
were accomýpanied by a large degree
of spiritual'powver,, indicative of the
pleasing fact that the religious life of
London has become mu'ch.quickened;
indeed, a ser-vice is seldomn held ivitlh-
out conversions taking place,

At the Mis*sionary J>reakfast pur
oivn noble Geo. Macdougall occupied
no mean position, as he detaîled, in
his own graphic style, ivhat lie had
seen effected by the Gospel among
the red men of the distant North-
west,

Homze Missions.-The object of
this society is to, aid poor circuits,
extend the Gospel among the masses,
and especially aid the work of evan-
gelization in -the armny and navy
of England. Rev. C. Prest is Secre-
tary, and pursues bis work wvith an
atmount: of zeal that-is truly astonish-
ing, considering that lie bias been
nearly flfty years in the ministry.

Froin the report we Jearn that
ninety-three home rnissionary minis-
ters are employed. Twelve ministers
are labouring amongst the Wesley-
ans in the army and navy, a ndý at
the garrisons of Dublin and Mlalta,;
eiglkty-flve married ininisters have
been sustained wvholly, or iii. part,
during the year by the Home Mis-
sion Fund.; seventy-five Home Mis-
Sion stations, having answvered their
purposes, have been incorporated n
the ordinary circuit arrangements;
sixty-nine ministers',.hôus'es have
beeii provided in connection witli
the Home Mission stations, and dua-
,ring the last sixteen years grants
amounting to $50,ooo have beell
made fromà the H-olme U~issionary
F und ýto, aid in' furnisàing two him-
dred and thirty-fourrninisters.'houses;,
the increase ofiiethbers on the Home
Missions. ig.six hundred and twenty-
tg-gr; six, hundred, regular se.rviceý


