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and iiot tili a few hiours before his death. The interval of con-
sciousness in most cases is variable, but seldom extends beyond
an hiour and a haif. Ericksen describes a case tint did not
become unconscious for three and one-quarter hours. Treves
states that an interval of twvo or three days may clapse before
compression symptomis set in. In this case, however, conisciaus-
ness lasteci for between two and three clays after the accident,
thoughi the paralysis came on sorne eighit or ten hourq after the
accident. The explanation may be founci in that cither extra-
vaisation ýN'as very slow andi the adhesions betw\eeni the dura and
the skull very strong, or- that the hiemorrhagye ceaseci and mvas
ligh ted Uip again by suibsequénît exertion, such as the long -valk
lie took. Mr. Towers, in the Lancet for Aug-ust, 1903, clescribes
a case in which compression symiptoms di-d not come on for
fifty hours after the accident, but this lie explainied by the fact
t).liat the patient struggOlecl violently wvith an attendant in en-
deavoring to gyet out of bed, and so restai-ted *emnorrhage,
which hiax stopped.

3. Large ailnount of dlot. The quantity seldoni exceeds
four ounces; five and one-h-aif ounces %Nas the inost EYickçsen
liad seen. In this particular case I measured eighlt ounces my-
self, and thei-e wvas considerable- removed subsequently, s0 that
theïe was at least ten ounces of dlot removed. As shown in the
Olrawilig, a cavity wvas left between the brain and the skull ai-
niost large enough to hold one's fist.

Iii conclusion, I should like ta briefly review the case, and
at the saine time dwell upon the great importance and value of
getting at complete histovv of every case that cornes to anc.
This unfortunate man was sent into ils with the- sunniosition tint
hie had an apopleptic seizure during the nighit previously ta his
admittance. No one came with him but the ambulance men, and
they knew nothihg more about him than tînt lie liad sanie slight
accidlent, and hiad gone hiome apparently littie the wrorse of the
accident. We neyer heard wlnt reallylhad lhappened to him till a
few hours before his death, wlen his wife g-ave us the detaîls
previously given. It is needless ta say that, ha'd lie been tre-
phinied shortly after «being admnitted, hiýs chances for recovery
would have been very mucli better, indeed. \Vith a complete
history, the case was very typical of menline-eal hemorrhage. He
hiac the initial sliit amiount of concussion, with flic interval of
consciousness lasting for some days, thc graduai onset of com-
pression signs while still conisciaus of everythinig, an'd coma,
withI deathi supervening- in spite of ail that hiad been clone ta.
save him.


