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LETTER

FROM C. S. CZOWSKI & dO.,
TO THE

CITIZENS OF TORONTO.

Onmncnr,—Your Oity Oounoil having laat

night decided to adopt the report of their Com-

mittee on the Esplanade, and to discharge ub

from our duties as eoatractors for that work, we
deeire to address to you those remarks and ex-

planationa, which would have been made to your

Oouoeilt had their conduct towards us not been

characterized by such a want of good faith and

eommon justice, that self-respect prevented our

holding any communications with that, body

—

except such as, up to this time, we have been

obliged to take, in defence of our legal rights.

Our relationg to your city, aa contractors, being

BOW terminated, by the act of your own repre-

entativea, we have bo longer any hesitation in

putting before you such a statement of facts, as

moat be conclusive as well of our own good

ftith as of the reckless indifference to the sacred

obligations of honor and honesty, and of the

beat intereata of the city, which have character-

imd the prooeedings of a majority of jour
Council.

We felt it oar duty, on a previoua occasion, to

tete to the Maynr the facts connected with our
eonlraot, up to a certain point We did so in

hopea that that statement would have induced
the Oity to pause, before consummating an act

of wrong and of bad faith. But we speedily
found that our anticipations vera erroneous, and
we have therefore waited the final action, fore-

eeing that the conclusion was decided and fore-

gone, and that, if we acted prematurely, we
might only succeed in pointing out a better way
for our cpponenta to injure us, without the
alighteat hope that we should receive justice.

Our poaition towards the city of Toronto has
been that of parties who have entered into a so-
leoan contract and agreement, and who have, in

relluiee on the faith of the city pledged to them,

expended a ver^ large snm of money, and in-
curred most aeriona liabilitiea. Under auch cir*

cumstances, it will not be denied that it was the
duty of the Council, before perpetrating an act
fraught poaaibly with the most ruinoua conse-
quences to UB—and, also, impugning most aeri-

uusly the fair fame annd integrity of the city

—

to determine, by a moat careful and impartial
investigation, whether any sufficient grounds
existed for breaking their engagement with ns

;

and if such grounds did exist, whether they alae

justified a breach of covenant towards the Grand
Trunk Railway, fortha right of way through
Toronto.

Mow, in the first place, we put the question to

every candid citizen here—Have the Council se-

cured a careful and impartial ioveatigation ? It

must, in the first place, be borne in mind that

the Council were one party to the contract—we
were the other. The Committee appointed by
them, had as its chairman a person (Mr. Adam
Wilson) committed, in the most decided way, to

prove, out fat naii nrfai, that the whole contract

was based ia fraud and extortion ; and the ma-
jority of the members were equally so pledserf.

Assuming, however, that when named aa judgea,

they would forget their prejudices as aecuseta, it

might have been expected that common fairness

would have dictated, in an enquiry of the kind,

that the other party to the contract—ourselvea—
should have been allowed to be represented, and
that they would at least have given ua the op-
portunity of meeting our accusers face to face,

hearing their evidence, and defending ourselves

by such proof as we might possess. The Com-
mittee did nothing of the kind. They never in-

timated to us a wish, or oven permission, thatwe
should attend, aa partiea to the investigation.

They never gave us the slightest opportunity of

cross-examining their witnesses, or adducing
testimony ouraelves—and even had the audacity
to expect as to appear aa witneaaea before them,
in a case in which we had at least e^ual r^hta
with the city, and to aubmit to the inqaisition


