
pounds of buffalo pemniican. In
making this supply for the Free
Press he lias used the meat of
reindeer exclusively. Some of it ht
has made plain ; some of it is berry
pemmican. It has been prepared
with the greatest care, and the
Hudson's Bay Company guaran-
tees it to be genuine reindeer
pemmican of the very best quality.
Fort McPherson, the Hudson's Bay
Company's post where it was made,
is on Peel River, a few miles
from its junction with the Mac-
kenzie River. To be exact, Fort
McPherson is between parallels 67
and 68 of north latitude and a short
distance east of the 135th meridian

;

it is sixty-five miles within the Arctic
Circle, and eighty-five miles from the
coast of the Arctic Ocean. The
pemmican was brought from Fort


