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attractive. Tho coilege opcned free of delit, but
the endowmient is stili smali.

The opening corem-onies extonded f rom Monday
niglit, Oct. 14, tii! Wednesday morning, Oct. 16.
On the first eveing( a sermon 'vas clivered by
Rev. Dr. Pale of Birrninghain.

Tuesday morning communion service wvas lield,
conducted by Rev. Principal 'Reynolds, D.D., of
Cheslîunt Coliege, assisted by Rev. R. F. liorton.
An hiour later Principal Fairbairii deiivered the
inaugurai address. lie considereci the idea and
purpose of the coliege and its relations to, the
universitv'. Fie urged that in ,the spirit of the
earlier history of the university sucb a college had
a natural place in it. The cause of its foundation
was the sanie as timat of Merton, the oldest of the
colleges. As to the special causes tbat hiad called
Mansfield into being, iDr. Fairbairn suggested the
possible sigaificance of the college as a religious
society, inifluencing the life and timoughit of th6
university. It was miow a vital question how
religion wvas to be niaintained in a university.
The answer to this lay through tbe question, Whiat
ouglit a university to lie 1 It oughit to lie tbe home
for ail the inteilectual and moral and religious
forces that educated and helped and lifted the
people. It best fulfilled its functions whien it
drew froin ail] tbe people that its service of the
people miglit lie more adequate and more complete.
The rîse of Mansfield meant the creation in once
suspicious and estranged classes of confidence and
interest. They came, therefore, and establisbied a
coilege iii Oxford, because they loved tbe truth
their fathers hiad iived ýby, and they believed that
timore these truthis could lie best studied, thieir
mninistry best fornied, and thieir duties to the future
of their people and their faitiî, so far as they de-
pend on academie activity, -'vork and. discipline,
lie best fuifilled.

Lunch wvas served in a tent on the coliegye
grounds. Mr. Albert Spicer, the treasurer of the
college, presidcd, and among the guests %vere a
number of leading Churchmen connected ivitlî the
university. iRev. C. R. Palmer spoke of the delit
wvbicli America owved to the universities of Oxford
and Cambridge, the interest taken in Mansfield
College in Amierica, and said that the American
people gloried in the return of Nonconformityý to
Oxford after 227 years of exile. In the evening
Dr. and Mrs. Fairbairn gave a reception in tlue
college, which wvas largely attended.

The exercises closed wvith a breakfast in the
college dining hall. About sixty guests wvere pre-
sent.* Greetings wvere rend by Principal Fairbairn
fromn Chicago Theological Seminary, Professor
Harnack of Berlin and Dr. Pressensé of Paris.
Among the speakers were Professor Hatch of
Oxford, Professor Symonds, Principal Cairns,

and Professor Bruce of Scotland. Mr. Palmer
spoke for Amierica.

Thus ended this most remarkable event. The
college is opening under most favorable auspices,
and is certainly destined to play an important part,
not only in the history of Congregationalism, but
likewise of ail Englisbi Nonconformnity.-Ex.

MR. JAMES BLACKIE, STOUFFVILLE.

On the 29th of October our beioved brother,
James Blackie, in bis sixty-fourtb year, entered
bis Fatber's bouse above. At tbe agye of seventeen
in Edinburg, Sctiand, 1ho0 united wvith a Congre-
gational Churcli. Emigrating to tbis country two
years later, as soon as possible lie united wvith the
Stouffville Congregational Church, under the
pastorate of the late Brother L. Kribs. For
forty-five years, lie w'as an upriglt, devoted, earn-
est, loyal member of the Churcli. For twventy-five
years lie wvas a good deacon, faithful to bis trust;
besides filling otiier offices of service for the
Chureh's prosperity. Ris cliaracter stood out
before men during those years, blarniess. The
verdict of all whlo kiiew 1mi 'vas, lie 'vas a good
manî. - is love to the means of grace and attend-
ance tiiereon wvas faithiful to the end. iHis re-
mioval from. our midst is a feit loss, that wvill not
soon be renioved. iiaving suffered for sorne time
withi a chronie weakness, taking, cold brougyht on
an aggravation of bis trouble wlîich endcd his
earthiy life. Ris mmid wvas clear and bis heart
calm and peaceful to the end. In bis great
weakness he would say, "Jesus is so, precious!'
As hie lived, so lie died, in peace wvitb God and
man. lie left a wvidow and two sons and six
daughiters to m-ourn his loss; ail of tbemi professing
Cbristiaxs.- Comi.

G~ur CoIIege CZoIumln.

The Rev. Dr. Jackson is delivering his first
series of lectures on the liistor$' of iDissenters.

Dan. S. IHamilton is staying out of Collegye a
year, and is employed as book-keeper, at a salary
of $1000 by Mv-'cKnabb & Co. of this city.

WE cal! the attention of the Editor to the fact
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