
poorer countries. In particular, more stable long-term 
finance, such as direct investment from industrial 
countries, should be encouraged. We welcome longer-
term debt restructuring agreements between debtor 
countries and commercial banks. We continue to stand 
ready, where appropriate, to negotiate further multi-
year reschedulings of debts to governmwents and 
government agencies. 

We continue to encourage the constructive 
dialogue with the developing countries in the existing 
international institutions with a view to promoting their 
economic development and thereby their social and 
political stability. We emphasize the crucial role of, and 
the improved cooperation between, the International 
Monetary Fund and the World Bank Group in support-
ing policies by debtor countries necessary to 
strengthen the confidence of domestic and foreign 
creditors and investors, to mobilize domestic savings 
and to ensure efficient use of resources and sound 
long-term development. We agree to work to ensure 
that these institutions are equipped with the necessary 
resource and instruments, and we stand ready to 
discuss an increase in the resources available to the 
World Bank which may be necessary in the coming 
years. We remain concerned over the particular 
problems facing a number of developing countries that 
are neither among the poorest nor foremost among the 
group of major debtors. We agree that consideration 
should be given to easing the financial constraints of 
these countries on a case-by-case basis. 

We are deeply concerned about the plight of 
African peoples who are suffering from famine and 
drought. We welcome the positive response from our 
citizens and from private organisations, as well as the 
substantial assistance provided by the governments of 
many countries and the establishment by the World 
Bank of the Special Facililty for Subsahara Africa. We 
shall continue to supply emergency food aid. In 
addition, we shall intensify our cooperation with 
African countries to help them develop their economic 
potential and a long-term food strategy, based on their  

own agricultural programmes. We are prepared to 
promote increases in food production by supplying 
agricultural inputs such as seed, pesticides and 
fertillizers, within the framework of agricultural develop-
ment projects. We agree upon the need to improve the 
existing early warning systems and improve transporta-
tion arrangements. Political obstacles in the countries 
concerned should not be allowed to stand in the way 
of the delivery of food to the hungry. We emphasize 
the need to examine the establishment of a research 
network on dry zone grains. We shall strengthen our 
cooperation with African countries in fighting against 
desertification. Continued efforts are needed by all 
countries in a position to contribute to any or all of this 
work. We call upon the Soviet Union and other Com-
munist countries to assume their responsibilities in this 
regard. We have set up an expert group to prepare 
proposals for follow-up measures to be reported to 
Foreign Ministers by September 1985. 

Multilateral Trading System and 
International Monetary System 

Protectionism does not solve problems; it creates 
them. Further tangible progress in relaxing and dis-
mantling existing trade restrictions is essential. We 
need new initiatives for strengthening the open mul-
tilateral trading system. We strongly endorse the 
agreement reached by the OECD Ministerial Council 
that a new GATT round should begin as soon as 
possible. Most of us think that this should be in 1986. 
We agree that it would be useful that a preparatory 
meeting of senior officials should take place in the 
GATT before the end of the summer to reach a broad 
consensus on subject matter and modalities for such 
negotiations. We also agree that active participation of 
a significant number of developed and developing 
countries in such negotiations is essential. We are 
looking to a balanced package for negotiation. 
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