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on the right side froin disease-of the right
ear, and 12 ou the left from disease of the
left ear, and in one case there was abscess
on both sides following disease of both
ears. Similarly, of 61 cases of thrombosis
of the lateral sinus, 35 were met oun the
right side and 26 on the left. Of 23
cases of meningitis from ear disease, 17
affected the right aide and 3 the lefrL
Adding these together, we have a total of
115 cases, of which 70 wer.n on the right
side, 44 on the left side, Yîrd 1 bilaterai.
Korner traces the greater frequency on
the right side tc the fact that the groove
for the lateral sinus passes further for
wards and outwards into the petrous and
mastoid bones on the right than on the
left aide. The bony val] seperating the
sinus from the mastoid antrum is there-
fore thinner on the right side. Added to
this is the fact that in brachycephalic
skulls the anterior cerebral fossa is con-
siderably nearer the mastoid antrum than
in the dolichocephalie. In the former,
cerebral complications of ear disease more
readily ensue than in "the latter.-
Deutsche 2[ed. Zeitung.

ACETANILID AND ANTIFEBRIN. - The
Jounal has several times called the
attention of its readers to the fact that
antifebrin and acetanilid are identical
chemical- products. Then why shouild
physicians continue, as some of them do,
to prescribe the "proprietary" antifebrin,
which costs at wholesale twenty-five cents
per ounce, while the non-proprietary ace-
tanilid costb but seventy-five cents per
pound, or not quite five cents per ounce.
Notes on new Renedies, published by
Lehn & Finir of New York, points out
the fact that the German government does
not protect the manufacturer of "anti-
febrin," and that bis product is soid in
that country at about thirty-five cents per
ounce, which would make the price here
-freight and duty added-fifty cents per
ourca The moral of this is that Ameri-
can physicians should always prescribe
the. non-proprietary acetanilid.-Indiana
3ledical Tourai.

FOEIGN BODY .THE Ba .-- The
following case vas receitly the subject of
a coroner' snquest.W.., aged 38
came othes hospital complaining ot weak-

ness and shortness of breath. It was
found that there was odema of the legs
and albuminuria, and patient was ad-
mitted. On further ezamination he was
discovered to have extensive phthiEis of
both apices. He gave a history of an old
injury tothe head, for which he was treated
as an in-patient at St. Barthromew's
Hospital. He had not suffered fron head-
ache, vomiting, fits, or any other cerebral
symptoms. Opthalmoscopic examination
showed that the fundus was normal in
both eyes. There vas slight alcoholic
tremor of the hands. At the post-mwrtemi
examination, on opening the skull, a
portion of the blade of a penknife, about
three-quarters of an inch in length, was
found impacted in the left temporal bone,
passing down into the fissure between the
middle and inferior frontal convolutions,
to which its plane vas parallel. The dura
mater vas thickened around the site of
puncture. There was no injury to cere-
bral tissue. On exam:eing the outer
table the point of entry vas found to be
covered with scar tissue. There vas an
old, pale cicatrix on the scalp.

THE DRY METHOD OF OPERATING.-Dr.
W. W. Van Arsdale, in the Annals of
Surqery, describes a dry method of op-
erating as practiced by Dr. Landerer, of
Leipsic, and reported by him in a paper
before the late Congress of Surgeons in
Berlin. The method consists in not
allowing a drop of fluid ai any kind to
come in contact with the wound during
the operation. The hands of the operator
and the field of operation are cleansed
first with soap and water and theu with
a 1-2000 solution of sublinate in alcohol.
As soon as the first incision is made no
more fluid is allowed to come in contact
with the wound. Sponging is done
with pieces of sublimated (absorbent)
gauze, and al parts are kept tanponed
with it, except at the point where the
surgeon is working. Hemorrhage is much
lessened by this method; hardly any
vessels in the muscles require ligation,
As soon as the operation is flnished and
the larger artesries are tied, the wound is
to be kept tamponed for a few minutes
withwgauze,.ifter which it presents abso-
lutely tdry aurfaces,-and ia- Iiexcellent


