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pride, vanity,, ana,& a dbP.Rng pas-
.siQfl5, and ep -present him in hie
,nearest possiblo reseinble4lce to a
*perfeoled, qpaele himaniity.

Thore je, howeyer, a teohunioai cul-
ture ini Freemasonry by ne means te
be disrego6rded-a culture impQrtnt
in îtzelf. andl alsa as conetituting au
essential preparation for that more
general work of enlightenment and
discipline already indicatedl. Mza.unio
culture ie a phrase that must carry
,with it, fir8t of ail the ider, of an un-
derstanding of the system whioh je
included within the broad lines of our
Fraternity. There eau be no culture
sunob as je entitled to the prefix of
Masonic, uniss a due amount of
etudy has been given to the under-
lying principles and. teachinge of
the institution, thereby reaching some
elear perceptions as to its character
a-àcd purposes. Thon thers must bo
an acquaintance with forms and cere-
mzoniee, so ae to know what theso
-observances are, when nsod, buty ap-
plied, and how related to each other,
together with their moral significanco.
It je a mistake to suppose that oxie
can acquire ail needsd culture iu
these matters, by 'Ipassing through"
the various dogrmes and orders which
belong to the Masonie syetem, or
witnessing now. and then-at very
,distant intervale, porliape-the rend-
ering of the vzork. Something more
je xequisite if one would. beoa culture
Mason, even according te this lower.
forma of desigriation. The i.nquiring
znmd must apply its powers to dis-
cern thointended application of varied,
forme ana practices,-the meaning of
ceremonies that in theinselves may
appear very silly, but which rightiy
undsrstood, will tak-e on a vsry dif-
ferent character. The intelligent
Orgftsman wilI of neceesity be a etu-
,dent in respect of whatevsr belonga
te the presoribed expression of m~a-
sÔnic trnth, wliile hoe will note with
cars al signe aud tolena-symbols as
ivell as wordsi-bsaring upon the
illustration of theae varions lessons

Jbrought to bis attention.

.*]aj3o.Die culture, -even -as t1Xl.a
limited, IMaýes too =pay demande on
brethren to be altogether popular?
biumzé cannot give the, Lime; Borne
hiavé''not' the inolinàtion; otheri do
not realize the worth cfi snob S'tu dy
and application; whilo others, Who
are prompt attendants upon festival
occasions, seemingly cars nothing for
the Masonic system or organization,
3xcept as its social features are pre-
sented. Aud se the clase of the non-
oultured je exceedingly large. Breth-
ren take ail the degrees and g' ;n
high honore, but they do not mastar
the firet priuçoiples in the science of
Masonry; they do not study the ritu'£
nor give careful scrutiny to the ce.-e-
mony; they do not think, read, and
investigate, in order te hecome culti-
vated and proficient in the royal art.
It neede no argument to show that
such as these add but littie to the
etrengîli and efficiiency of the organ-
ization. Only the well-informed andl
.,'el-discipied-they who compre-
bend the esseutial nature and genun
of the Masonia system-can bo relied
upon to stand by the Fraternity i
anay exigency that may arise, ana ta
ho faithful under ail conditions and
at ail limes. 0nt sacred trusts are
safe only as ability, intelligence, and
virtue shail have prevailing power ini
the hearte and lives of brethren-
only as such a class shall bave con-
trolling influence iu the Counsele of
the craft. They w.ho are thus cul-
tured, being well versed in the techni-
cal lore of Freemasonry, underatand-
ing ils history, and appreciating bolli
its philosophy and ite moral teaoh-
ings, are best prepared to make it
productive in its most important us
for the practical good. of men, and ta
lead. il on in the way of a true pro.
grese. They are to, be the teachers,
helpers, inspirera of others lese in-
formed. and. less strong-tsmembsr-
ing always thé law of duty and, xe-
eponsibility te which they are boundk
"-Unto whom much je givén, of the
saine muol is require."ý-PF-nzamW»s
Repository.
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