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PHOTOGRAPHS of the First Compaq ot Reserves tor the First Newfoundlaad Regiment—These that have just left here !
We have individual Photographs of each man, Groups of each Section, and the 

Non-Commissioned Officers, men being inspected at Government House,
Going aboard the Steamer etc., etc.

____. THE HOLLOWAY STUDIO, LIMITED,
Corùer Bales’ Hill and Henry Street» St. John’s Nfld.’PHONE 768.

War News.
Messages Received 

Previous to 9 a m.
m:ss COMMENT.

TOe 'Courier Journal' says: “Civil­
ization should abjure its neutrality. 
It should rise as one mighty Godlike 
force, and as far as its moral influ­
ence and physical appliance can be 
made to prevail forbid tlie riot of 

- jiale and debauch of blood that, like a 
madman, is runuing amuck among 
the innocent and unprotected. Every 
pulpit in America should send prayer 
lo God in protest. Every patriot 
minister of the Gospel of Christ 
should lend Ills voice in protest, and 
more than ail, the Christian Presi­
dent of the United States, a cool and 
brave man, sprung trom a line of her­
oes and saints, ceasing longer to pro­
test should act, leaving no doubt in 
the minds or hearts of any that he is 
not merely a leader in Christ, but a 
leader of men and of the nation, and 
that he holds aloft the sword of God 
and of Gideon.”
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HOSTILE AIR CRAFT RAID.
LONDON, May 10. 

Warning of the approach of hostile 
air craft was given Southend at 2.52 
o'clock this morning. Several .ma­
chines took part in the raid, but 
whether they were Zeppelins or aero­
planes, residents were unable to state 
as the weather was foggy. Bombs 
struck houses in various parts of the 
town, hut no deaths have been re­
ported. One man and his wife were 
badly burned in a fire which ’ was 
started by an incendiary bomb. One 
resident told of three bombs drop­
ping near his home, none of which 
caused damage. It is reported that 
several shops were burned at Leigh 
Town, near Southend. Four Zeppe­
lins are said to have dropped forty or 
fifty bombs there.

ed States to be drawn into the Euro­
pean conflict. Considerations, such 
as military impotence of the United 
States to affect the course of struggle 
abroad, and possibly the entry of this 
country into war, would automatical­
ly cause reduction in supplies of am­
munition to the Allies, because ol 
greater need at home, have Influenced 
many officials to the belief that dis­
approval of the United States can be 
voiced in a far more effective way 
without declaring war. The with­
drawal of Ambassador Gerard, with­
out actually severing diplomatic re­
lations, has been suggested in some 
official quarters as one way of indi­
cating the feeling of the American 
Government. Other officials intimate 
that a complete severance of diplo­
matic relations, until complete re­
paration and aprilogy is made, prob­
ably would conform to the wishes of 
American public opinion.

Smri.ATKIN RIFE AS TO WHAT 
TIIE V. ^ WILL DO.

WASHINGTON, May 10.
Speculation as to what thq United 

States probably would do as protest 
against torpedoing the Lusitania, de­
veloped among officials and diplo­
mats to-day. The general opinion is 
that the President would express in 
the policy he pursued in denuncia- 
tion of the act as inexcusable under 
the laws of nations and humanity. 
The extent of his action, whether it 
would go beyond an emphatically 
phrased note or an actual severance 
°- diplomatic relations with Germany, 
is still undetermined. When the Cab­
inet meets to-morrow, the President 
kill probably present to his col­
leagues his ideas of what the Gov­
ernment policy should be. it is now 
tertain that the President does not 
intend to call Congress in an extra 
lession. This disposes, for the pre- 
eent at least, of the suggestion that 
Germany’s action will cause the Unit-
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QUEENSTOWN, May 10.
Affidavits made by Miss Jessie Taft 

Smith, of Braceville, Ohio; Dr. Ho­
ward L. Fisher, Major F. Warren 
Pearl, and Robert Rankin, of New 
York, are the only permanent records 
of the Lusitania disaster obtained by 
the United States Consulate here. All 
are brief, and none reflects seriously 
upon the behaviour ot the Lusitania’s 
crew, except what some witnesses 
consider a lifeboat fiasco. At Consul 
Frost’s orders, the bodies of the iden­
tified Americans were removed from 
the scattered morgues and placed 
side by side in the Cunard Line Office 
on the waterfront. As they were car­
ried through the streets by British 
sailors, crow-ds viewed the uncovered 
coffins.

borated in the terrible crime. “I 
propose to ask the Jury,” he contin­
ued, “to return the only verdict pos­
sible for a self-i-espécting jury, that 
the men in charge of the German 
submarine were guilty of'wilful mur­
der.”

The ship’s bugler, Livermore, testi­
fied that the watertight compartments 
were closed, but that the explosion 
and force of water must have hurst 
them open. He said that all officers 
were at their posts, and that earlier 
arrivals of rescue craft would not 
have saved the situation.

Captain Turner testified briefly. 
The Coroner asked him:

“You were aware threats had been 
made that the ship would be tor 
pedoed?"

“We were," the Captain replied.
“Was she armed?”
“No, sir.”
“What precautions did you take?"
“We had all the boats swung when 

we came within the danger zone, be 
tween passing the Fastnet and the 
time of the accident.”

The Coroner asked him whether 
he had received a message concern­
ing‘the sinking of the ship by sub­
marine. Turner replied that he had 
not.

“Did you receive any special in­
structions as to the voyage?”

“Yes, sir."
“Are you at liberty to tell us what 

they were"?"
“No, sir.”
“Did you carry them out?”
“Yes, to the best of my ability."
“Tell us in your own words what 

happened."
“After passing Fastnet, the wei- 

ther was clear,” Turner answered.- 
“We were going at 13 knots. I was 
on the port side, and heard second 
officer Hefford call out, ‘Here is a 
torpedo.’ I ran to the other side, and 
saw clearly the wake of the torpedo. 
Smoke and steam came up between 
the last two funnels. There was a 
slight shock. Immediately after th: 
first explosion there was another re­
port, but that may possibly have been 
internal. I at once gave orders tc 
lower the boats down to the rails 
and I directed the women and chil­
dren should get into them."

FRENCH OFFICIAL REPORT.
PARIS, May 10.

The French War Office gave out 
the following this afternoon: Three 
new German attacks to the North of 
Lombacrtzyde were repulsed yester­
day to the East of St. George’s. Our 
marine fusiliers took possession of 
Union Farm which was very strongly 
fortified by the Germans, and also of 
a portion further to the East; they 
made 300 prisoners. Dunkirk was 
again bombarded this morning, two 
shells being thrown in the region to 
the north Of Arras. We have main­
tained all important gains reported 
in the communication of yesterday 
evening. Along the rest of the front 
particularly in Argonne and in Al­
sace, at Sillaken Wasen, there was 
a continuation of artillery fighting.

CORONER’S JURY INVESTIGATING
KINSALE, Ireland, May 10.

The Coroner’s Jury investigating 
the deaths attending upon the loss of 
the Lusitania, returned the following 
verdict: “The Jury find that this 
appalling crime was contrary to In­
ternational Law and conventions of 
all civilized nations, and we therefore 
charge the officers of the. submarine 
and the German Emperor, and the 
Government of Germnay, under 
whose orders they acted, with the 
crime of wilful and wholesale mur­
der."

Coroner Hartman said the first tor­
pedo fired by the submarine did seri­
ous damage to the Lusitania, but that, 
not satisfied with this, the Germans 
discharged another torpedo. The sec­
ond torpedo, he said, must have been 
more deadly, because It went right 
through the ship, hastening the work 
of destruction. The characteristic 
courage ot the Irish and British peo­
ple was manifested at the time of 
this terrible disaster, the Coroner 
continued. There was no panic. Hp 
charged that the responsibility lay on

BONAR LAW SPEAKS.
LONDON, May 10.

Our enemies have reached a degree 
of infamy, culminating in the de­
struction of the Lusitania, which is 
simply hopeless to attempt to de­
scribe, said Andrew Bonar Law, it 
a speech to-day. His remarks were 
delivered on the occasion of the' pre 
sentation of a medal to Capt. Bell, o! 
the British steamer Thordis, whicl 
rammed a German submarine ot 
Beachy Head in February. This if 
not an act of warfare, he continued 
but simply murder, most foul and 
most unnatural.

Saying that up to the present nc 
effective protest had been made by 
any neutral country, he added, wha' 
will happen now, in the great, proud 
nation of the United States, the neu 
tral country most closely affected by 
the latest outrage? It is a simpli 
fact that citizens of that country 
have been barbarously murdered. 1 
is not for me to say what their actio; 
ought to be, but I feel sure that tin 
United States will be guided no' 
merely by the monetary interests o 
the country, but by their feelings a; 
to what is due a great nation amon? 
the other nations of the world. If thr 
sinking of the Lusitania had the ef 
feet he believed it would, on the feel 
ings, hot only of British soldiers, bu 
of the whole nation, then we ca: 
thank the Germans for this last in 
stance of their barbarous methods.

BERF.SEOBD ON UHURVHILL.
LONDON, May 10.

First Lord of the Admiralty 
Churchill, said in the Commons to­
day that Capt. Turner had acknow­
ledged receipt of messages from thr 
Admiralty, warning directions for the 
course he was to take. The Admir­
alty had general knowledge of the 
German warning issued in America, 
he declared. From that knowledge 
and other information concerning 
submarine movements, it had sent 
warnings to the Lusitania and direc­
tions as to her course. I think, how­
ever, it is not right to go into that 
matter in detail, as it is going to be 
the subject ot inquiry. It might ap­
pear I was endeavouring to throw 
blame on the captain of the Lusita­
nia in a matter which will be the 
subject of full Investigation. Con- 
tinhfnfe, he said, this inquiry would 
be continued by Lord Mersey, assist­
ed by skilled assessors, and would be 
opened without delay. Churchill’s re­
marks were drawn by questions froi/i 
Lord Charles Beresford and others.

By Stéphane
To-Day Î

N. Y. Chicken.
N. Y. Turkeys.
N. Y. Corned Beef.
Bananas.
Grape Fruit.
Pineapples.
Table Apples.
California Oranges.
California Lemons.
J10 crates New Cabbage.

» brls. Parsnips.
200 half bags P. E. I. Bine 

Potatoes.
10 bags Onions.

Celery.
Fresh Tomatoes.
Cucumbers.

Dutch Butter
1 lb. prints.

23 els. and 27 cts. lb.
Whole Wheat Biscuits, 16c. pkg. 
Knox’s Gelatine—Plain and 

Acidulated.
Pure Gold Quick Gelatine.
Yal. Oranges, large sweet,.

20c. doz.
Evaporated Milk, large tin, 12c. 
Price’s Night Lights, 15c. pkg. 
Force, 14c. package.
Cranberries, 30c. gallon.
Fresh Halibut.
Fresh Country Eggs, 25c. doz. 
Kippered Herring.
Finnan Haddies.

T.J. Edens

Churchill answered that the Premier 
had handed him Beresford’s letter; 
and that it had been carefully stud­
ied at the Admiralty, and its sugges­
tions had already been adopted on 
the largest possible scale.

ST. PIERRE BULLETIN.
May 10th.

In German works captured yester­
day near Lens we made hundreds of 
prisoners. At Bagatelle, in Argonne, 
oui troops repulsed three attacks, one 
during night of 7th and 8th and other 
two yesterday. ■«

Midnight:—Between the sea and 
Nieuport the Germans attacked but 
were repulsed suffering heavy losses. 
The British troops have advanced in 
Fromelles District. We realized sub­
stantial progress north of Arras, in 
direction of Loos and south of Car- 
ency; in the latter district we captur­
ed on a front of 7 kilometres two and 
even three lines of German trenches 
strongly fortified. We have captured 
the village of Targette and one half 
of Neuville Slvast village. Our ad­
vance in depth reaching on certain 
points 4 kilometres we have taken 
over 2,000 prisoners and 6 cannons. 
In Champagne we repulsed an attack 
near St. Thomas, on the border of 
Argonne. At Bagatelle we have been 
able to verify the importance of the 
losses sustained by the enemy during 
their attacks of yesterday. Germans 
again used asphyxiating bombs and 
fiery liquids without any success. On 
remainder of front, especially at Le 
Pretre Wood and Sillskerwasen, artil­
lery contests.

the German Government gad . Uic ^asking /details as to what speed the 
whole people of Germany who colla- Lusitania was making when she was

torpedoed; whether there was a pa­
trol boat in that locality; whether all 
points where vessels arrive and de­
part are now patrolled; what provis­
ion was made in the case of the Lu­
sitania in view of the warning issued 
n America; whether Churchill was 
tware, previous to last Friday, that 
German submarines had for some 
time been actively at work on the 
south coast of Ireland; and finally 
what arrangements, if any, were 
made to convoy and protect the Lust- 
ania. Churchill replying to further 
questions, spoke as follows: The 
shocking exception of the Lusitania 
should not divert the attention of the 
Commons and country from the fact 
hat Britain’s entire seaport trade 
sad been carried on without appreci­
able loss. The general principle re­
garding the providing of escort is 
hat merchant traffic must look after 
tself, subject to general arrange 
nents by the Admiralty. There is no 
•eason to suppose that this principle 
s not entirely successful. Bonar 
Law asked if an answer had been 
received from the captain of the Lu­
sitania showing that the Admiralty 
■nstructions to the liner had come to 
his hands. Churchill replied that 
,’ooth mesages had been acknow- 
edged. The second acknowledgment 
same a short time before the attack 
was made. Beresford asked it As­
quith had received his letter of April 
15th, warning him of the peril that 
had met the Lusitania, and whether 
this warning had gone unheeded.

With good health at your 
back you can do anything.

If you are troubled with Head­
aches, Dyspepsia, Biliousness and 
kindred sickness you can’t expect 
to accomplish much.

Dr. WILSON’S
HERBINE BITTERS
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GERMAN COMMUNICATION.
BERLIN, May 10.

The following despatch has been 
sent by the German Foreign Office to 
the German Embassy at Washington: 
Please" communicate the following to 
the State Department. The German 
Government desires to express its 
deepest sympathy with the British 
Government, which through its plan 
of starving the civilian papulation of 
Germany, forced Germany to resort 
to retaliatory measures. In spite of 
the German offer to stop submarine 
war, in case the starvation plan was 
given up, British merchant vessels 
being generally armed with guns 
have repeatedly tried to ram sub­
marines, so that previous search is 
impossible. They cannot therefore.be 
treated as ordinary merchant vessels. 
A recent declaration made in the 
British Parliament by a Parliament­
ary Secretary in answer to a question 
by Lord Charles Beresford, said that 
at present practically ail British mer­
chant vessels were armed with hand 
grenades, besides it has been openly 
admitted by the English press that 
the Lusitania on previous voyages 
carried large quantities of war ma­
terial. On the present voyage she 
carried 5,400 cases of ammunition, 
while the rest of her cargo consisted 
chiefly of contraband. If England, 
after repeated official and unofficial 
warnings considered herself able to 
declare the boat ran no risk, and thus 
assumed responsibility for human 
life on board the steamer, which, ow­
ing to its armament cargo, was lia­
ble to destruction, the German Gov­
ernment in spite of its heartfelt sym­
pathy for the loss of American lives, 
cannot but regret that Americans felt 
more inclined to trust English prom­
ises, rather than pay attention to 
warnings from the German side. 
Signed by the Foreign Office.

Soper & Moore.
’Phone 480.

Hr. Grace Notes.
A good woman of the town had 

three $1 bills Snugly placed in an en­
velope for a rainy day, and last week 
in Some unaccountable way she toss­
ed the envelope unto the stove, re­
membering after a few minutes .that 
it contained the dash. She kept it 
for a rainy day, and last week was all 
wet days, but—-

Messrs. Saunders and Howell are 
now getting the finishing touches on 
the splendid new palace for His 
Lordship Bishop March. It is ex­
pected that the building will be ready 
for occupancy by the end of the 
month..

The harbor is still filled with ice 
sbü nothing can be done as tb fishing 
or in fact anything that calls for work 
on the harbor.

CORRESPONDENT.
Hr. Grace, May 10th, 1915.

Sale oi Work.

fighting with small Russian territori­
al- forces.

HARCOURT.

FRENCH MAKE PROGRESS.
PARIS, May 10.—(Official.)

To the north of Arras, in spite of 
German counter-attacks, we have 
maintained all our gains, yesterday. 
We have enlarged it on certain points 
notably between Carency and Cau- 
chez.

Our success is developing. The 
total number of prisoners up to three 
o’clock to-day exceeded 2,000. Among 
these were about 40 officers, includ­
ing a Colonel.

We have captured the last two days 
more than ten cannon and fifty ma­
chine guns.

At Berry au Bac a German attack 
has been repulsed, as well as one in 
the forest of La Pretre.

CHURCHILL SPEAKS.
LONDON, May 10.

Winston C. Spencer Churchill said 
in the Commons to-day, that a Board 
>f Trade inquiry will be held to de­
termine the circumstances attending 
the loss of the Lusitania. In the 
neantime it is premature to discuss 
the matter, he continued; but I must 
nake it plain, that in no circumstan­
ces will it be possible to make public 
the naval dispositions for patrolling 
">ur coast. Our resources do not en­
able us to provide destroyers and es­
cort for mail and passenger ships.

OFFICIAL REPORT.
London, May 10. 

The Governor, Newfoundland:
General French reports May Stli, 

fighting continues southeast of Ypres. 
A trench lost on the day before was 
recaptured. The enemy violently at­
tacked our trenches between Ypres 
and Poelcapelle and Ypres-Menin 
Roads. Fighting is proceeding.

The report on the 9th states that 
enemy attacks, east of Ypres, contin­
ued. All were repulsed with heavy 
loss, and our lines are firmly estab­
lished. Our first army attacked the 
enemy’s line between Bois Grenier 
and Festubert, gaining ground south­
east towards Fromelles. Fighting 
continues. Our airmen raided vari­
ous points successfully.

The British destroyer Maori struck 
a mine off the Belgian çoast on Sat­
urday. The crew were saptured as1 
well as the crew of boats from the 
destroyer Crusader, attempting a res­
cue; in all 7 officers and 88 men.

The Frençh Governmént report con­
siderable progress north of Arras ami 
south of Carancy. In the latter re­
gion, on a front of seven kilometres, 
two or three lines of the enemy 
trenches were captured. The village 
of La Targette and half the village of 
Neuville Saint Vaast were taken. Ad­
vance at some points was four kilo­
metres deep. Over 2,000 prisoners 
and six guns were taken.

The Russian Government report oc­
cupation of Lihau by the enemy after

BRITISH REPULSE ATTACKS.
LONDON, May 10.

Field Marshal Sir John Frencli re­
ports no change in the general situa­
tion to-day.

Our line east of Ypres, in spite of 
repeated attacks by the enemy dur­
ing the last week, is substantially 
the same as that to which we with­
drew on the night of May 3 and 4, ho 
says in his report to the War Office.

During the fighting in this quarter 
yesterday, the enemy made five un­
successful attacks, his losses in these 
failures being very heavy. On the 
front of tlie First Army, fighting to­
day has been confined to artillery 
action.

ANOTHER STEAMER TORPEDOED
LONDON, May 10.

The British steamer Queen Wilhel- 
mina, of Hartlepool, was torpedoed 
off Blyth on Saturday. Time was al­
lowed the crew to take to boats. The 
men were picked up by a patrol boat 
and landed at Shields. The Wilhe;- 
mina was engaged in trans-Atlantic 
trade. She was 2,307 tons net and 363 
feet long.

AWAITING AUSTRIA’S REPLY.
PARIS, May 10.

The Government of Italy to-day 
awaits the final reply of Austria, says 
a Rome despatch to the ‘La Liberté.’ 
In the interim the publication of im 
portant decrees which were signed at 
the last meeting of the cabinet, has 
been withheld. I learn from an ex­
cellent source that unless the Austri­
an answer arrives before midnight 
to-night, or if the reply is unfavor­
able, Italy will consider tlie negotia­
tions terminated.

GERMANS LEAVING ITALY.
BERNE, Switzerland, May 10.

It is estimated that ten thousand 
Germans from Italy crossed the 
Swiss frontier on Saturday, and four 
thousand arrived at Lugano alone.

Suffer No Longer
From Constipation!

You can immediately relieve and 
permanently cure yourself with Dr. 
Hamilton’s Pills. One thousand dol­
lars will be paid for any case that 
isn’t corrected within three days. Dr. 
Hamilton’s Pills contain no injurious 
drugs; they are composed entirely of 
soothing, vegetable extracts that 
strengthen the stomach and bowels at 
once. It is absolutely impossible for 
Dr. Hamilton's Pills to fail curing 
biliousness, sour stomach, indigestion, 
headache or constipation. Every one 
box has brought vigor and renewed 
health to chronic sufferers, so you 
oVe it to yourself to try Dr. Hamil­
ton's Pills at once; 25c. per box at all 
dealers.

The sporting"' costume may be 
brightened by adding a bright belt 
to the coat and a hand of the same 
color on the bat.

The Ladies’ Aid of George Street 
Church purpose holding a Sale of 
White Work to-morrow in the base • 
ment of the Church. Plain and fancy 
articles, at reasonable prices have 
been prepared by the ladies, and they 
are anticipating a liberal patronage 
from the public. Tea will be served 
from 4 to 7 o’clock. Musical selec­
tions will be rendered during the 
evening. Keep the evening free and 
assist the workers in their effort to 
aid in building the new Sabbath 
school, so badly needed in connec­
tion with' this church.

Commercial Cable 
Company’s Offices.

Mr. W. J. Ellis was awarded the 
contract for the building of the new 
offices of the Commercial Cable Com­
pany, which is to be erected to the 
West of King George V. Institute. 
The building is to be of freestone, 
brick, concrete and steel and no wood 
is to be used, as it is intended to bo 
absolutely fire-proof. When finished 
it will have cost about $80,000.

In Thousands 
of Homes

early and certain relief is found 
for the ailments to which all are 
subject—ailments due to defective 
or irregular action of the stomach, 
liver, kidneys or bowels—in the 
most famous family remedy, 
the world has ever known.

are justly famous because they have 
proved to be so reliable as correctives 
or preventives of the sufferings, dull 
feelings and danger due to indigestion 
or biliousness. If you will try them 
to cleanse your system, purify your 
blood, tone your stomach, stimulate 
your liver and regulate your 
bowels, you will know why so 
many rely cn Beecham’s Pills to

Insure Health 
and Happiness

■*# * Ct
Largest Sale of Any Medicine in the World*

Sold everywhere. In boxé». 25 cents

Wedding atGrand Falls
FREW—HOPSON.

On Saturday, May 1st, Miss Mary 
R. Frew, of St. John’s, was quietly 
married to Mr. Frank Hopson, of Sit- 
tingbourne, England. The ceremony 
was performed at the residence of the 
bride’s father, Mr. Wm. Frew, by the 
Rev. W. T. D. Dunn; only the immedi­
ate relatives of the contracting par­
ties being present. The bride was 
gowned in white satin and looked very 
charming. Miss Ireland and Mrs. 
Morse in the capacity of bridesmaids 
also added their quota of beauty to 
the little assembly. The groom was 
supported by Mr. Morse, his brother- 
in-law. In the evening a reception 
was held and a very enjoyable even­
ing was spent. The couple were the 
recipients of quite a number of pre­
sents, which were very useful as well 
as extremely pretty, and spoke very 
highly of their popularity. The fol­
lowing Sunday night Mr. and Mrs. 
Hopson left for St. John’s, where 
they remain as guests at the Balsam 
Place till Thursday when they re­
turned to Grand Falls. Congratula­
tions from all sides are meeting the 
newly married pair, and if wishes can 
bring happiness, it is theirs already.

Cape Report.
CAPE RACE, To-day.

Wind W., fresh, weather fine; no 
field ice, several bergs in sight break­
ing up; the three-masted schr. Mil­
dred passed in to-day. Bar, 29.29; 
ther. 42.

MOBILIZED!—50,000 bottles 
of Stafford’s Liniment for killing 
Rheumatism, Lumbago, Neural­
gia and all Aches and*Pains.
ffllnard’s Liniment Cures Dandruff.
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