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OF the importance of the study of Elocution as part of
a good education there can be no question. Almost every
one is liable to be called upon, perhaps at a few minutes
notice, to explain his views and give lis -opinions on sub-

jects of various degrees of importance, and to do so with
effect ease in speaking is most requisite. Ease implies
knowledge, and address in speaking is highly ornamen-
tal as well as useful even in private life.

The art of Elocution held a prominent place in ancient
education, but bas been greatly neglected, in modern
times, except by a few persons-whose fame as speak-
ers and orators is a sufficient proof of the value and ne-
cessity of the study. The Ancients-particularly the
Greeks and the Romans-were fully conscious of the
benefits resulting from a close attention to and the practice
of such rules as are fitted to advance the orator in his pro-
fession, and their schools ôf oratory were attended by all
classes; nor were their greatest orators ashamed to ac-
knowledge their indebtedness to their training in the art
for a large portion of their success. The Welsh 'Triads
say " Many are the friends of the golden tongue," and,
how many a jury has thought a speaker's arguments
without force because bis manner was so, and have found
a verdict, against law and against evidence, because they


