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sion, to be appointed by the respective Governments, shall be
laid befoie them, with sueli other evidence as either Government
niay submait.'

The answer to the first five points was practically a foregone
conclusion. The court has decided upon al of them. in favour of
Great Britain. The answers to the first, second, and third were
even concurred in by Judge Ilarlan, one of the two Ameian
arbitrators, and on the point that the Behring Sea is a part of the
Pacific Ocean they were unanimous, the American denial of this
being too much even for the patriotic Seinator Morgan. On the
fifth point the two American arbitratoirs stood aloof, the British,
French, Italian and Norwegian arbitrators being otherwise unani-
mous. The decision on this question is a theoretically important
one. It is that 'the United States has not ariy right of protec-
tion or property in the fur-seals frequenting the isiands of the
United States in Behring Sea when such seals are found outside
the ordinary three-mile limit.' This is an authoritative state-
ment in favour of the three-mile limit which has lately been
exercising the minds of foreign international jurists.

So fair this is satisfactory enough, but the Americans presuma-
bly do not care what tho groundas are so long as what they get le
what they want.

The British Comm issioners proposed that a close season should
be provided, extending from Septembor 15 to, May 1, during
which all killing of seals should be prohibited, and tbat no seal-
ing vessels should enter Behring Sea bofore July 1. They stated
that, as a fact-, Behring Sea ie flow usually entered by the pelagie
sealers between June 20 and JuIy 1, that the seals begin to travel.
towards Behring Sea about June 1. NQw, it ie only when the
seals are on their- way to Behring Sea thut the Canadians have a
chance of catching them. Great Britain bas acquiesced al
through in the principle of a measure for the preservation of seal
life, but ehe contended that the mensure should not be one-sided,
and that they should include the regulations of the slaughter on
the breeding islande, which are under the exclusive jurisdiction
of the United States.

The United States on their side contended that the entire sup-
pression of pelagic sealing was the only measure by which, the
utter destruction of seal life ln the North Pacifie could be pre-
vented.

Let us now see how the tribunal has deait with the question.
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