
through which we advance our Arctic foreign policy and promote Canadian Northern 
interests. It is a consensus-based, high-level intergovernmental forum that promotes 
the environmental, social and economic aspects of sustainable development and en­
vironmental protection in the Arctic region. The unique structure of the Council brings 
both the eight Arctic states and the six Arctic Indigenous Permanent Participants to­
gether around a common agenda—enhancing the strength and effectiveness of this 
unique multilateral forum.

Canada will engage with Northern governments and Permanent Participants to ensure 
that the Arctic Council continues to respond to the region's challenges and opportuni­
ties, thus furthering our national interests.

From Canada's perspective, the Council needs to be strengthened to ensure that it is 
equipped to address tomorrow's challenges. Canada will act on several fronts.

First, we will pursue a greater policy dialogue within the Council. The Council has tra- 24/25 

ditionally played a strong role in science, research, monitoring and assessments, and 
the development of guidelines (e.g. for oil and gas) in some select areas. Canada will 
play a proactive role as the Council moves forward to encourage the implementation 
of guidelines, the development of "best practices" and, where appropriate, the nego­
tiation of policy instruments. The current negotiation of a regional search and rescue 
agreement (the first ever attempt at a binding instrument under the rubric of the Arctic 
Council) will serve as an important test case and will inform the scope for future policy 
endeavours. Canada will also work to ensure that the research activities of the Council 
continue to focus on key emerging issues to ensure that solid knowledge underpins the 
policy work of the Council.

Second, Canada will lead efforts to develop a more strategic communications role 
for the Arctic Council. As the profile of the Arctic increases, the image of the Council 
and information about the broad range of cutting-edge work that it is doing need to


