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AN APPEAL TO CAMPER S.

The Canadian Forestry Association
is endeavoriflg to sec ure .the co-opera-
tion of Canadian fishermen. hunters
and campers in making a special
effort to adopt fire prevention this
year as one of their personal con-
tributions to national thrift.

Names and addresses of three
thousand guides and sportsmen have
been received, ail of whom-wîlI re-
ceive a personal appeal to keep fire
out of the forests, in 1917 in-so-far as
lies in their power.

The Association would be glad to
hear, from Quebec, New Brunswick
and Nova Scotia members who are

in a position to distribute special
literature to campers and others, or
who knowý of organizations of guides
that -cari be brouglit into touch with
ire prevention work.

A general newspaper and magazine-
campaigri has been carried on this
month, hundreds of newspapers from
coast to coast assisting the Associa-
tion by 'printing special articles ap-
pealing to pleasure seekers to take
care of their camp flres and to adopt
every precautioli with fire in any
form.
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DEPARTMENT 0F FORESTRY
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Best of f acilities for definite in-
struction and supervision in Practi-
cal Forestry.

Surveying, cruising and construc-
tion work carried on in our own
tract of 3600 acres, wîth Forestry,
Camp in the centre.

Competent men from the School at
peetin demaad to take up Forest
Suvywork with the Provincial

Crown Land Department.
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