
Oncogene 
A gene that plays a role in the 
transformation of normal cells 
into cancerous cells. Some 
viruses are oncogene carriers. 

Pathogen 
Something that causes disease: 
pathogenic microbe. 

Photosynthesis 
Reaction through which chlo- 
rophyllic plants transform light 
energy into organic substances. 

Polymer 
Long chain macromolecule 
formed by a repetition of small 
structural units. 

Porphyrin 
Essential biological pigment 
(e.g., chlorophyll, red blood 
corpuscles). 

Protein 
Macromolecule formed by a 
chain of amino acids that are 
joined together. They are the 
building units of all living beings. 
The proteins that catalyse the 
metabolic reactions are called 
enzymes. 

Restriction enzymes 
Particular enzymes, present in all 
cells, that are capable of recog-
nizing and destroying DNA. 
Restriction enzymes are used in 
genetic engineering as biological 
"scissors" to cut the DNA and 
recombine it with other 
fragments. 

Yeasts 
Single-celled fungi. 
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