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case and others, including a very recent case of Re Wal
City of Toronto, in the Appellate Division, il O.W.N. 1

With much reluctance, the learned Judge dismissed thE
and with costs.

MIDDLETON, J. DECEMBER 18T

RE LOCKER.

Wffl - Construction - "Nearest Heirs" - Ascertain,
Evidewc - Incompletene8s - Notice.

Application, upon originating notice, by the lexecuto
Looker, deceased, for an order determining certain ques
to the construction of the will.

The motion was heard in the Weekly Court at LoAndo
W.-C. Brown, for the executor.
G. S. Gib)bons, for the widow.

IMXDDLETON, J.,. ini a written judgmenf, said that the
gave his lands to bis wife for life, and "at her deati
nearest hieirs that are alive at lier death. " The testator
the lSth December, 1915, leaving a widow but no ebildr
the argument it was said that he left as bis heirs a haif-sist
brother, but that both were now dead; the haif-sîster
issue, and the brother Ieft children, ail of age.

The learned Judge's view was, that there was a gifi
testaitor's heirn, i.e., to those who were bis heirs at his dea
tingent upon their surviving the widow, and an iritestac
the remiainder, which would resuit in vesting the estat(
heirs fin the events that hiad happened); and, îf the hf
<lied intestate, and the brother aise dîed intestatte, wot,
in the brother's children the rernainder expectânt upon
estate, so that a fee simple nxighit be conveyed.

But, unfortunately, the facts did nlot seem to be as stat
haif-sister was net xnentioned in the papers, and it waý
that there were twe children hnrn to the testator's mot.
two to his father by earlier marriages (one, no doubt, t
aiter), and all that was muid was, "Soîne of the chil
aforesaid Ior their heirare now livinig." It was netsaid i
haif-uister and the brother died intestate. This was probsj
case, but it sheuld be shewn.

Notice must be given te the living half-brot liers or


