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duties, would recommend. »» a like general rule,

tlie allowance of drawbacks in favor of the man-
ufacturer. . . . VIll. Tlu" encouragement of

new inventions and ilisioveriei at home, and of

tlic intro<luction into the United States of such
as may have been made in other countries; par-

ticularly thi.se which relate to machinery. This
is ummig the most u.seful and unexceptionable

of the aids which ran l)e given to manufactures.

Till' usual means of that encouragement are j)e-

curiiiiry rewanis, and. for a time, exclusive

privileges. . . . IX. .ludicioiis regulations fur

the iiiHiMCtion of manufactured <ommoilities.

This is not ainon!; the least important of the

means liy wliieli the prosperity of manufactures
may lie "pronidted. It is indeed ill many cases

one (if the most essential. ('ontrilMiting to pre-

vent frauds upon coiismners at home and ex-

porters to foreign countries, to improve the

qualitv and preserve the character of the national

manufactuns; it cannot fail to aid the expedi-

tious and advantageous sate of them, ami to

serve as a guard against successful competition
frmn other quarters ... X. The facilitating

of pecuniary remittances from place to place—
is a point of considerable moment to trade in

general and to manufactures in particular, tiy

rendering more easy the purchase of raw ma-
terials and provisions, and the payment for

manufaeturi'd sii|iplies. A generil circulation

of bank p.. per, which is to be expected from the
Institution lately established, will be a most
valuable ini an to this end. . . . XI. The facili-

tating of the transportation of commodities.
Improvenieiils favoring this object intimately

concern all tin; domestic interests of a commu-
nity ; liiit they may. without impropriety, be
nientiiined as having an important relation to

ininiifartures. . . . Thi- foregoing are the prin-

cipal nf the means by which the growth of man-
ufaeiiiresisnnlinarily promoted. It is, however,
not merely necessary tiiat the measures of gov-
eninii'nt which have a ili't't view to manufac-
tures .should be calculated to assist and protect

them; but that those which only collatcrallv

atT<(t them, in thci general course of the aii-

niinistratioii. should be t'uardeil from any pe-

culiar tindeiicy t.i injure them. There an/ cer-

tain spi'( ies of taxes which are apt to \>f

oppressive to dilTererit jiarls of the commui/ity,
and. among other ill elleels, have a very un-
friendly aspeit towanls iiiaiiufactures. All poll

or eapitalioii taxes are of this nature. They
eitlier proceed .iccordiiis; to a lixed nite, which
operates unequally and injuriously to the indus-

trious poor; or they vist a discretion in certain

olllcers to makeestinialesand assessments, which
are nccissirily va^-ue, eonjiilunil, and li.able to

abuse. . , . .Vll such taxes (including all taxes

on occup.-itioiis) which proceed accordimr to the

amount of caiiiial supposcil to be employed in a
business, or of proiiis supposed to be maiie in it,

are uiiavoi.lablv hurtful lo indu.strv."^A. Ham-
ilton, A'./n/r "',' M,ii.Hf.i,-liir(a ( \\'.>rkK. r. :!).

Al.so IS: St:il,- I'.ipirn unil S/HyluK "ii the

Tiriff.—\{. \V. Tlioni|ison. lli>t. / Pn.l,rlin-

f.r.f hf-,, rl,, i!_7.

I England): A. D. 1815-1828.—The Corn
Laws and Provision Laws.—The sliding-

scale.— Iluriiiu' the .Napoleonic wars in Kurope
tlicii' w:is a proloniieil pcriiHl of scarcity, u])-

proatjiinir to famine, in tlreat liritain. There
were scant harvests at huuic oud ^supplies from

abroad were cut otT by the " Continectal system "

of Napoleon. " In 1801 wheat was 11,% shillingi

and 11 pence per quarter; from IHOl to 1818 the

firice averaged 84s. : whilst in the 20 years end-
ng 1874, it averaged only 5'is. per quarter. . . .

The cry of starvation was everywhere heard
amongst the working classes, and tradesmen of
all kinds suffered severely; whilst the only well-

to-do people were the Farmers and the Landlords.
As soon as the war was over, and our ports were
ojicned for the reception of foreign grain, prices

came down rapidly. Then the Ijindlords took
alarm, and appealed to Parliament to resist the
Importation of foreign grain, which they as-

Bert4><l, would be the ruin of the English Farmers.
They Insisted that in this country, the costs of
cultivation were extremely heavy, as compared
with those of foreign producers of grain, and
that therefore the British Farmer must receive
protection in order to prevent his ruin. Hence
a Parliament, eomposi'd mostly of Landlords,
priK'eeded, in if<\!i. to enact the Corn Law,
which excluded foreign wheat, except at high
rates of duty, until the market price should
reach 80s. per quarter ; and other kinds of

grain, until there was a proportionate elevation

in prices. Tlie discussions in Parliament on
this question m.ule a great impression, and led

to a widespread svmpatliy, and to the belief that

there was need of a measure, which, according
to its advmates, wouM preserve our Agriculture
from ruin, and be at the same time a provision

against famine. Hut by man^ thoughtful and
patriotic people this law was viewed w ith intense

dislike, and was characterised as an atrwious
fraud. The fact was, that . . . when rents

ought either to have iM-cn lowered, or the
metho<ls of cultivation improveil, the Corn Law
was passeil liy the Landlords in order to keep
out foreign corn and to maintain high rents; and
many of the common people saw, or thought
they saw, what would be the effect ; for whilst
the legislature was engaged in the discussion of
the ipiestlon, the people of Lonilon became riot-

ous, and the walls were chalked witli invectives

such as ' Bread or Ulood,' 'Guy Fawkcs for ever,'

etc. A loaf, steeped in blo(i<l, was placed on
Carlton House, (now the Tory Club House.)
The houses of some of the most unpopular of
the promoters of tin- mi'asure were attacked by
the mob. At Lonl KIdon's house the iron rail-

ings were torn up, whilst every pane of glass

an<l many articles of furniture were broken and
destroyed, and it was fa<etiously remarked that
at last his lordship kept open house. The mili-

tary were 1 -died o'lt. and two persons were
killed; the Houses of Parliament were giiardi'd

by soldiers, and. in<leed, the whole of London
appeared to be in posM'ssion of the Army. In
various parts of the country similar dis-

turbances prevailed. . . . Lari;e popular meet-
ings were held at Spa Fields, in I.<indon. public
meetini;s were also lielil at Birmingham, and in

many othir parts of the kini:iloni. . . . In some
of the towns and populous localities, the opera-
tives having in view a large aggregate meeting
to lie held on St Peter's field in Manchester,
submitti'd themselves to marching discipline.

. . . Regardless, however, of the public demon-
strations of dislike to the Corn and Provision
Laws, the Leeislatiire persisted in upholding the
most stringent provisions thereof until the year
ISSii, when the duties ua the importatiun at
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