
“ What countries are they sent to ?” asked 
the girl.

“ Australia, New Zealand, Argentina, 
Great Britain, Germany, Russia, Switzer­
land, Denmark, Norway, Italy, Holland, 
Belgium, Roumania, Austria, Asia Minor, 
Cape Colony, Orange River Colony and 
Natal. A few are even sent to Palestine, but 
as you can imagine the demand is not very 
large for them in that country.”

“ I suppose a great many are sent to the 
United States, as we buy so many from 
them,” she remarked.

“ On the contrary, our agricultural imple­
ments are completely shut out of the United 
States by their high tariff,” said her uncle.

WOULD SHUT THEM OUT

* If 1 were making the Canadian tariff I 
would raise it high enough to shut theiPs 
out of Canada,” said the girl.

“ So would I,” said the student. “ Why 
it is evident that if all those imported imple­
ments were made in Canada the beneficial 
influence would be felt in every branch of 
trade. Every factory in Canada would have 
to increase its output and all those millions 
of money now sent to the United States 
would be put into circulation in Canada, 
turning over and over again as the workmen 
employed in the factories and those engaged


