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Germany ; and there is no, reason %vhy mecthods wvhich arc sa
'Successful in those counitries should îiot b:! equally so liee, pro-
vided the grcater cost of labor be not an insuperable obstacle.
Figures given by the Amierican expert, I3irk-enbhîce, for the

Ottawva district, sine ycars ago, placccl the cost of mantifacturc,

even under the then un favorable conditions, at such a price as

to fairly wvarrant investment at sonie central point such as
Ottawva city, and to mnake thc crection of a blast furnace profit-

Sable, but the initial cost of suich an enterprise is hicavy and
investors prefer often to take thecir chances in somne more gilde?.
schemie, even though, as is ofteil the case, thc resuits arc flot
alwvays very flattering. H-o\v'evcr this country is as yct coin-
paratively yi>ung in inininig tuatters and the attention of foreign
capitalists is niow onily being directed to this p)ortion of the
empire as a field for profitable investmntt, so that it is nlot worthi
wvhite to become greatly discouraged over a present dep)ression
along certain lines.

GRAPH>1ITE.

Among the other inerai industries that at somne not
far distant day promise to be a very irnportant factor in the
country's developmnent is the mmining of graphite. We have in
the Ottawa district some of the largest ând rnost valuable
deposits of this mineraI anywhere knownv, and easy of access,
and though efforts have been made in a half-hearted wvay for
some years to turn these to profitable accounit, such attempts
have been sa carried on as miot ta yield satisfactory returns. In
such a case wve should not attribute the lack of success ta, any

j fault on the part of the ore deposit, since this has been thoroughly
inve.-:igated in the laboratory of the Geological Survey, and the
mineraI found ta equal in quality, for ahl practical purposes, that
from the celebrated mines of Ceylon, wvhich so Iargely enter the
markets of the %vorld to-day. The failure rathier seems ta be on
the part of those who have the mines iii charge, and to their Iack
of enterprise in seeking a market, since the Canadianl market
alone consumes annually a sufficient amount of this material ta

t warrant the wvorkings of these deposits on. a large scale. Thus


