
trust Indenture of Indenture*, before

referred tu, and be entitled tu the bcne-

flt thereof, notwithstanding such loans

and pavnupnt and ilUrhar^e;
(d.)Th« balancM at the credit of the

•aid spsoial aeeount or aeeeunta shall

ba eraditad with intarast at such timaa
and at sueh rates as may ba agraad
upon batwaan tha Paclfio Company and
tha bank holding sama, and tha aaid
balaneas shall from tima to tima ba
transfarrsd to ths Paoifle Company,
or Its nominoas, In monthly paymsnts,
at far as practicable, as ths construc-
tion of the lines of railway aforeeaid

ie proceeded with to the satisfaction

of the government and accordina to
the speoification or standard deter-

mined by this contract! and from
time to time, ae the work of construc-
tion proceeds, the government, by the
minieter of finance, or other duly ap-
pointed representative of the govern-
ment, shall, out of the said balances,
certify to the bank the amount to be
transferred from the said account to

the credit of the Pacific Company, or
its nominses, in monthly payments, as
far as practicable, such sums as are
justifiable, having regard to the pro-
portion of work done, and material and
supplies purchased for the said rail-

way, as compared with the whole work
drne and to be done thereon, pending
completion of the said lines; arid ths
government shall fron* ''-no to time, as
required, transfer to th^ Pacific Com-
pany any interest earned by the
moneys so on deposit in any such bank
to assist such company in paying ths
interest accruing on any outstanding
Suaranteed securities hereunder. The
alanea at the credit of such spscial

account or accounts shall, until paid
out as above provided, be deemed part

of th'i premises includsd in said trust

instrument, and shall not be taken to

be public moneys received by the pro-

vince.
iO. Should the earnings of the Paci-

fic Company during each or any of

the ilrst three years of operation, after
completion of the aided lines, be In-

sufficient to pay the operating ex-
penses and Interest on the guaranteed
secirltles, the government shall pay
the amount of such deficit of Interest

to the Pacific Company, or such per-
sons, firms, or corporations as maybe
entitled thereto. Any moneys so paid
by the government shall be repayable
(except as hereinafter provided) by
the Pacific Company at the maturity
of the guaranteed securities, and shall

bear Interest at four per cent, per an-
nuiBL, which interest the Pacific Com-
pany shall pay or cause to be paid
half-yearly on the ftrat day of Jan-
uary and the first day .of July In each
year, but the Pacific Company shall

have the prlvUeffo of repaying at any

time any auch moneya, whereupon ln<
terest upon the principal repaid aball
cease. The government uhall have tha
privilege of calling In the money ao
paid by the government at any time
after ten years after the said three-
>fur period, by six months' notice In
writing tu the company, whereupon
such money, with interest to date,
hull become and be payable to the
Kuvurnnient. Uald notice m-^, be given
ut any time during tlie last six months
of the ten- year term, or thereafter. In
the went i>f the guvernmeiit making
an issue uf securities tu procure any
money tu make any such payments, or
otherwise borrowing the sume, the
Pacific Company shall also pay to the
guvernmeiit any luss or expense which
the government shall be put to there-
by; but in such event the government
shall ttuki- into uecuunt uny Having nt
Interest by reason of such loan being
obtained, ur securities Issued, bearing
Interest at a rate lesa than four per
cent.

11. For the purpose of ascertaining
any deficits under the preceding partt-
gruph, no salaries paid by the Pacific
Company shall be taken as a dis-
bursement except those of such per-
sons as devote their entire services to
the company, or devote some substan-
tial portion thereof to the company,
and in the latter case a fair propor-
tion only of their salaries shall be
taken as disbursements.

12. The Pacific Company shall keep
during the currency of the bonds sep-
arate books of account In which sbait
be correctly set forth in full detail tha
cost of the said lines, the operating
expenses, and the earnings thereof, or
such as shuuld be properly credited
thereto, and It shall retain and keep
during such period all proper vouchers
and receipts; and any appomtee of the
government shall, at all reasonable
times, if permitted to inspect and
audit said books and vouchers, the
Pacific Company facilitating as far as
possible any such audit when so made.

13. The government hereby coven-
ants and agrees with the Northern
Company that it will covenant and
agree with the Pacific Company in
manner following, that Is to say:

(a.) To convey to the Pacific Com-
pany by free grant a rig'ht-of-way not
exceeding one hundred feet in width
for the said lines of railway above de-
scribed, in so far as the same extends
or shall extend through vacant Crown
lands of the Province of British Co-
lumbia:

(D.) To convey to the Pacific Com-
pany by a free grant such vacant
Crown lands of the Province of British
Columbia as may be necessary for sid-

ings, stations, embankments, cuts.


