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COMPANY OVERVIEW 
Genesis Research Corporation specializes 
in the production of high-quality NAPLPS 
graphics. Since its begirming in 1980, the 
c,ompany has concentrated on products 
for the home and educational markets. 

Genesis Research has proceeded on 
the premise that NAPLPS will only 
succeed if mass consumer services are 
developed and offered inexpensively to 
the public. 

EXPERIENCE 
The graphics information produced by 
Genesis Research has been used in 
major videotex systems across Canada. 
These indude the Grassroots systems 
in Manitoba and the Vista system in 
Ontario and Quebec. The international 
videotex market was entered when 
Genesis Research became the first 
information provider signed by the 
Keycom system in Chicago. 

Cable television has also been used 
extensively by Genesis Research. 
Winnipeg Videon Incorporated broadcasts 
entertaining and educational services 
produced by Genesis Research to its 
140,000 subscribers. Cable television 
systems across the United States 
receive Genesis Research productions 
via satellite. This application is rapidly 
expanding into many other countries. 

PRODUCTS AND SERVICES 
Genesis Research produces entertaining 
and educational information for use in 
homes and schools. A major portion of 
the information is in the format of 
children's picture storybooks which are 
both entertaining and educational. Other 
information is produced for a children's 
magazine which includes a variety of 
entertaining and educational material. 
These products are used for both one-
way cable television and two-way 
videotex systems. 

FUTURE DIRECTIONS/ 
TARGET MARKETS 
The company is rapidly expanding into 
the United States and many other 
countries around the world. The 
information produced by Genesis is 
distributed over telephone lines, by 
satellite, through television and other 
avenues. Even countries which are not 
primarily English- speaking are planning 
to use information produced by Genesis 
Research Corporation. 
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