
CERE3EIO-SPIN1NAL MENINGITIs.

brown colour in bed this morning; a few bright-red, slightly raised,
acuminate spots are out on her arms.

6 p.m.-Pulse 108; temperature 100.8.
Il p.m.-Respirations 21; pulse 112; temperature 99.6; lias

passed three motions-in bed during the day, and has occasionally
flèt the clothes as if measuring- tbe edge of the coverlet; if dis-
turbed would draw the bed-clothes up under her chin andthen
rest quietly; the àkin was very warm at six, now cool, with slight
cutis anserina To continue same medicines and applications, and
has for diet strong beef-tea with milk and eggs.

April 17th. Thursday, Il a.m.-Respirations 32; pulse 135:
temperature 99.5; rested quietly all night; not quite so conscious
as before, but knows those around lier, and asks for drinks;
passes evacuations in bed, but is apparently aware of it.

6 p.m.-Respirations 33; pulse 140; temperature 100.6; seems
conscious, but is not like lier usual self; gums slightly " touched,"
bleeding when pressed. Stopped Calomel powders.

April 18th.-Respirations 34; pulse 150; temperature 101.2;
slept from eleven last night till eight this morning, when she was
taken out of bed to have it changcd, during which process she
helped herself a good deal ailthough very weak; occasionally
picked at the bed-clothes during sleep; she asked to get up to
stool this morning although lier bowels were moved twice in bed
during the night; lias been very thirsty yesterday and this morn-
ing, talks quite sénsible but peevishly; bas abnormal sensations
e. g., imagines lier chemise is rolled up on lier back and wants it
pulled down; has some pain in the head, but appears to niove it
more easily than before; finished her medicine this norning. To
have an ounce of port wine every two hours.

6 p.m.-Respirations 34; pulse 135; temperature 98.4, is quite
conscious; knew lier father who came in from the country; takes
interest in passing conversations; was sponged all over; bowels
moved once iii bed after bath; taking only food and wine; alight
external'strabismus of right eye; forehead cold from p-ofuse per-
spiration.

April l9th.-Respirations 33; pulse 135; temperature 100.2;
has slept very quietly all night, and said nothing except ask for
drinks; passed thin, yellowish stool in bed about 8 a.m.; pulse
softer than it lias been; perspires freely and face flushes red at
times; is more correct in lier appreciation of sensations than she
has yet been, e. g., as to how lier clothes are arranged, and as to
impressions made by other things in contact with lier; bas perfect
use of her limbs; the pupils have always been widely dilated
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