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We must use whatever lawful means are at oui dispos-
ai to crush these bandits and common criminals who
would destroy oui nation. I further suggest that na
persan in this country need fear the loss of civil liberties
except those who are trying to deny the rest of us those
same liberties. The kidnappings were unfortunate. God
knows, we are ail praying that these men will corne out
of this situation alive. It is unfortunate that it took this
tragedy to precipitate us into action and to realize how
serious and dangerous the situation has become. In my
view we have no right ta spend the public's hard-earned
maney, garnered through taxation, ta support and
encourage certain of the means of communication in this
country ta subvert oui own people. I do nat think it takes
much imagination, when you turn on a television set or a
radio set, ta know what I arn talking about.

* (9:00Op.m.)

Some hon. Members: Hear, hear!

Mr. Cafik: We see these people subsidized as they
spread their vaices of hate across this nation. We recent-
ly set up a Committee on Pollution ta dlean up our
rivers, streams and air. Surely ta God we can do some-
thing ta clean up the filth that is being passed into the
minds of those who live in this country by those who
wauld subvert us.

I suggest that the government give seriaus considera-
tion ta the passage of a special act in this Parliament.
For want of a special naine I would entitie it the "Securi-
ty of the Nation Act." It would ciearly set out what lies
before those who would try ta destroy us, sa that they
would know their rights and we would know what powers
we had ta deal with them. Such an act ought ta be
introduced into the House and debated, with everyone
having a chance ta express his view.

I further suggest that the government give considera-
tion ta the following ideas in connection with the act ta
which I have referred. First, I believe capital punishment
should be reintroduced and made applicable ta anyone
who blackmails the state, its elected officiais or thase who
are entrusted with the enforcement of the law, such as
magistrates and judges. Second, capital punishment
should be the penalty for kidnapping and hijacking
which endangers the lives of human beings. Third, it
should apply ta bombing or other acts of violence direct-
ed against the state where danger ta human life is
involved. Faurth, we should deport those wha corne ta
this country ta encourage the commitmnent of any of the
offences ta which I have referred.

I do not think we can afford ta tolerate those who
advocate political violence in this country if they are not;
Canadian citizens. Indeed, I wonder whether such people
should be tolerated even when they are Canadian citi-
zens. Fourth, I believe that those wha belong ta associa-
tions which advocate the use of violence for political
purposes should be regarded as having committed a
criminal offence, the penalty for which is a minimum of
five years in j ail. Fifth, I believe that special powers
should be provided in any such act ta enable law
enforcement officers ta deal with insurrection in an effec-
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tive way. This would not be easy, because this section of
the legisiation would make permanent such things as
arrest without a charge being preferred, and s0 on. Per-
haps this section should only be implemented an the
orders of the Gavernor in Council. Sixth, I believe we
also have ta make provision ensuring that those charged
with sedition or treasonable activity are brought ta trial
more quickiy.

In addition, I believe two further steps should be taken,
though they have nothing ta do with the act I have
praposed. The government, in concert with other gavern-
ments, should make arrangements with friendly
natians-indeed, with ail nations, as far as possible-in
an effort ta have the death penalty imposed for interna-
tional kidnapping and hijacking offences. Efforts should
be made ta agree that such countries would not submit ta
national or international blackmail in any shape or form.
If this were done, we might see an end ta violence of the
kind which is s0 prevalent today. I also suggest that in
canjunction with ather states we should take action
against those nations which give politicai asylum ta
people who perpetrate such crimes. I support the interirn
measure which is now before us. Like everyone else, I
amn unhappy that it should be necessary. But it is neces-
sary, and I hope the government will take action by
setting up a separate act ta deal with this situation in a
permanent way in future.

I wish, now, ta make some comments on observations
made by hon. members opposite. I, tao, am disappointed
at the reaction of some members of the opposition. I
know that were I an opposition member I would have
supported this motion, outlined the potential dangers and
put the goverament on notice that it ought ta be very
careful, and that if At did not exercise these great powers
in a responsible way 1 would be on their tail. I do not
think it behooves anyane in this House ta oppose this
drastic measure taken in order ta ensure the security of
our country. The leader of the New Democratic Party
(Mr. Douglas) said earlier today that if he were the
captain of thîs ship of state, one of his first acts wauld be
ta get rid of me, a barnacle on the ship of state.

Same han. Members: Oh, oh!

Mr. Cafik: Same of you may laugh. You are the very
ones wha are getting up and crying for the civil rights of
the people of this country, yet attempting: ta deny me
mine.

Some hon. Members: Shame!

Mr. Cafik: I am no less important in this chamber than
any of the members opposite or those on this side of the
House, and when I have something ta say, I intend ta say
it.

Some hon. Members: Hear, hear!

Mr. Caflk: 1 suggest that the leader of the New Derna-
cratic Party ought ta be very careful before making such
stupid and senseless statements. It is unfortunate that I
have been so kind ta him, but that is my nature. I should
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