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number of stones for their use, and great 
interest is now taken in the sport. At New­
market, about 30 miles to the north of 
Toronto, there is a Curling Club, the minister, 
like many of his brethren at home, being an 
active promoter of the game, and an exact and 
skilful player. Curling is now also a favorite 
amusement at Dundas at the head of Lake 
Ontario; at Guelph, in the new District of 
Wellington; and at Fergus, in the township of 
Nicholl. There are also, many first-rate 
players in Scarboro’ who are always ready to 
measure their strength, in numbers and skill, 
with those of Toronto, and both enjoy the 
certamims gaudia in their annual bonspiel. 
They played at Toronto, on 12th February 
last, with twenty-four players aside, when 
their Excellencies the Governor General and 
the Lieutenant Governor were spectators of 
the game.

The Fergus Club has been mentioned above, 
but is worthy of more particular notice, being 
perhaps, the first which was regularly organ­
ized in Upper Canada. The settlement of 
that neighborhood was begun in 1834, and the 
gloom of the first winter was dispelled by the 
introduction of the g_ ne. In the course of 
the winter following, the Honourable Adam
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