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Vice-President, Marketing

ia Canvil Ltd. manufactures a complete line of quality steel
pipe fittings that includes forged steel fittings; lo-temp fittings;
forged steel unions; anvilets; couplings, plugs, bushings,
G.M.F.; nipples; and swaged nipples.

Canvil's products are produced in a stringent, quality-
controlled environment. The company is registered as a
qualified CSA Z 299-4 and Z 299.3 supplier by the Quality
Management Institute.
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n Established in 1946, Cello Products Inc. was one of the
early proponents of solder fittings in Canada. Cello has
concentrated on solder fittings for traditional plumbing and
heating needs and for use in the refrigeration and air
conditioning industries.

Solder fittings can be produced by casting; by wrought
process in which the fitting is formed from copper tube; by
machining from bar stock; or by forging. All methods are
used today to provide an exceptionally broad range of goods
to meet the needs of the contractor installing the copper
systems.

In its foundry, Cello employs high-speed electric induction
melting to produce better control of the alloy composition
with reduced costs. On the wrought process side, multiple
head, automatic forming and trimming machines provide
additional capacity. Computers for production and inventory
control permit Cello to manufacture high-quality, economical
copper-alloy solder fittings.
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Centoco Manufacturing Limited
2450 Central Avenue
Windsor, Ontario
Canada N8W 4J3
Tel: (519) 948-2300
Mc Tom Curlin
National Sales Manager

n Established in 1980, Centoco manufactures a complete
line of residential, commercial and institutional toilet seats. Its
Soft Designs series features injection-moulded, high-impact
polypropylene cover and ring cores (unbreakable under
normal conditions), and cushion-foam manufactured from the
highest quality furniture grade materials, ensuring maximum
strength while providing the utmost comfort. An exclusive,
revolutionary formula added to the vinyl forms a thin
transparent layer over the exposed surface of the seat that
acts as a deterrent to bacteria and fungi. Eight concealed air
breather vents provide optimum sanitation and prolonged
durability, and embroidery designs are manufactured with
durable and colourfast, high-quality thread on state-of-the-art
computerized equipment.
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