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Chicago over niglit, arriving in St.
louis Monday evening; passengers to
,bccupy sleepers 'whule in St. Louis,
car being side traclied near Clarkce
Avenue Street Car Line, near centre
of city. Boturning beaves St. Louis
Thursday nîght, 23, for Chicago
ivhere sicepor is dropped. Excursion-
ists can romain lu Chicago several
days on returu trip. Tickets and
é1eeper -ý$25.00, double berth occupied
by one person $5.00 extra. Send
application at once enclosing $7.00 as
guarantee to hold berth. Flease
notice that our sleeping palace cars
arc ruin direct through on fast express
to Chicago and St. Louis by daylight,
and that our excursionists occupy
aleepers tili returning to Chicago.
That is use of Palace Sleeping Cars
six days, and ticket goocl to return
eny time within fifteen days.' for
$25.00. Excursion for Masonic
ltnights Tqpplar, Royal Arch and
Master~ Masons, their families and
friends. The route for our special
cars is by Grand Trunk and Short
Lino to Chicago, through Detroit,
thence via Chicago and Alton to St.
louis. A superb route. Train
lbaves 9 a. m. sharp. The beEt ar-
rangements possible have been made.

WHIAT ST. LOUIS PAPEÈS SAY.

Over 25,000 in lino and will mardi
double section (12 abreast). The
mnardi wil lnot be a long one. The
ladies are decorating, St. Aldemar
head quarters at a cost of over $10,-
000. The Califoriiia decoration at
Armory will exceed $80,000, they
also bring a painting 100 ft x 40 ft,
asThe Eýnight's Templar entering
Jerusaleni."- The celebrated XIII
13attalion Baud of Hamilton, Canada,
und Gilmore's Baud of New York will
'bc amongst the 120 bauds present.

While the Fraternity are in St.
louis the Masonic Orpian Home
Concert takes place, 3,000 viusicians;
ever 60,000 tickets now sold. Grand
receptions to Knights' Templar. A
'nigit parade of St. Louis Trade Dis-
:play Association. Parade Flambeau

Battalion. Brilliant illumination of
St. Louis Exposition at its best, etc.
Canada Imiglits on parade are locatect
in l9th Division near Members Grand
Elicanipment.

(Address) J. H. MATTICE,
88 JmesSt.north,Haitn

AN ENQLISH FRATER'S OPINIO0N.

In a letter to the London Freema-
son's Chronicle IR. E. Sir Knight
Emra Hoinies, K. C. T., representa-
tive of the Sovereigu Great Priory of
Canada in the Great Priory of En-
land, says:-

I have received fr-or the Great
Prior of Canada an important state-
ment relative to the position of the
National Great Priory and certain
local bodies of Lznight Templars under
thejurisdiction of the Chapter General
of the Order in Scotland.

Great Priory dlaims absolute juris-
diction in Canada, and the Scottish
Knighits do pot seem to see their way
clear to give -ap their independence-
or allegiance to Scotland.

It seems to me, as I think it wiII to,
yonr readers generally, that the Scot-
tish Sir Kniglits are now% in a false
and an anomalous position, and it
would be înuch better for tliem and
for the Order lu Canada if they woulda
seek to be absolved from. their alle-
giance to the Grand Master of Scot-
land (which absoiution I feel sure
would be as readily granted by the
Earl of Rosslyu as a like request to
the Grand Master of England the
Prince of Wales when aslied for by
the Oreat Prior-y of Canada), ana
then they mniglit throw in their lçb
with the English Canadian Templars,
remembering that union is strength."

Undoubtedly if the advice of the
illustrions Frater was followed peace
would resuit throughout the Donin-
ion, and we are confident fhe Scottish
Teniplars would not suifer any disa--
vantage.
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