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128 A WRESTLE WITH NIAGARA.

lain idle. This was now put into requisi­
tion, and nobly she rode down towards 
the raft, whilst in breathless silence, we 
all watched her as she dipped at the vari­
ous falls, and each time recovered herself.
I shuddered as she was launched, for I 
began to see that the man could not be 
saved by a boat ; a boat never could re­
turn against a rapid, however well able to 
float down it. No sooner would her bow 
come into contact with a fall, than it would 
dip, fill, and spin around, as did the first 
skiff which was lost.

The poor fellow himself was getting 
impatient—visibly so. He untied his 
lashings, stood upright upon the raft, 
eagerly waiting to seize the boat, and 
jump into her. She had but one more 
fall to pass, and that fall was situated 
just above where he stood ; she paused 
at the brink of it, swung down it like 
lightning, and as he leaned forward to 
seize her, she rose on the returning 
wave, struck him on the chest, and he 
struggled hopelessly in the overwhelming 
torrent.

The exclamation of horror, for it was 
not a cry, which burst from the thousands 
who by this time were assembled, I shall 
never forget, nor the breathless silence 
with which we watched him, fighting with 
the waters as they hurried him along up­
right, waving both arms above his head 
We lost sight ot him at intervals, yet again I 
and again he reappeared, and I though: I 
hours must have passed in lieu of one brie:* j 
half-minute. But the end came at last H |, 
once more I saw his arms wildly wavecH tl 
above his head, and in an instant, th« e 
crowd turned from the spot in dead si-g a 
lence. The man was lost.

let down to him already, attached to 
strong pieces of new line, but the cords 
had in every instance been snapped, and 
the food lost.

The raft was finished, launched, and 
safely let down to the log. The poor fel­
low committed himself to its care, he lash­
ed his legs firmly, and then signalled to 
draw him up ; thus for the second time the 
ropes had begun to be drawn up, the raft 
advanced under the first pull, but its head 
owing to the great light cask, dipped be­
neath it, and as the raft still advanced, the 
water broke over it to such a depth that 
the man was obliged to raise himself upon 
all fours, keeping his chin well elevated to 
avoid being drowned. We expected at 
every pull to see his head go under, but 
alas ! they pulled in vain, for the front of 
the raft pressed down by the weight of 
falling water, had come in contact with a 
rock, and would r. it advance. The ropes 
were slackened, she fell back, but again 
hitched in her return. It was then deter­
mined to let her swing to another part of 
the rapid, where the stream did not ap­
pear quite so impassable. This was done, 
and a second attempt to draw it up was 
made, half-way between the log and the 
opposite shore (a small island). This also 
failed from the same cause, therefore it 
was proposed to endeavor to let the raft 
float down and swing round upon the is­
land. This was commenced but with the 
old result, the cable was caught in the 
rocks, and the raft remained stationary. 
However, she was floating easily, and the 
poor fellow would rest.

Early in the day, for the afternoon was 
now far advanced, one of the large ferry­
boats (built expressly for crossing beneath 
the falls) had been brought up, but had
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