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BUSINESS GUIDE: 

MOVING INTO MEXICO Ine 

industries, competing firms often form an alliance to make components used by 
all the competitors. 

FRANCHISING 

The franchise is a specific form of licensing, and is a rapidly growing segment of 
the market in Mexico. Most franchise operations to date have been pursued by 
American companies, partly because of the huge advantage that name recognition 
gives to American companies which advertise extensively in the North American 
market. However, the new law on intellectual property offers significant 
protection which may make this a growth area for Canadian companies as well. 

VIRTUAL CORPORATIONS AND RELATIONSHIP ENTERPRISES 

These are the newest and most distinct forms of collaboration. The virtual 
corporation might be thought of as a partnership of companies that will be formed 
on a temporary basis. Firms are brought together by computer networks and a 
specific market opportunity. Each member contributes only its core competencies 
to the research and development (R&D), manufacturing, marketing and servicing 
of the product or service. Once the task is complete, the partners are free to move 
on to other concerns. 

Relationship enterprises are much like their cousins, the virtual corporations, but 
the relationships they form are of a longer-term nature and involve larger 
undertakings. Due to the long-term component of relationship enterprises, they 
are more likely to be international in scope, which might eventually allow a 
relationship enterprise to operate on a home-country basis in each partners' 
market. Based on this qualitY, a relationship enterprise will have a competitive 
advantage over a multinational corporation in that it has (and will be perceived as 
having) many home markets, rather than only one. 

These new collaborative forms differ from traditional joint ventures in several 
respects: 

the individual production facilities of the collaborators are electronically 
connected and integrated, not created; 

IN the companies contribute their core competencies to the undertaking but do 
not transfer them; and 

the new forms of collaboration can be formed with comparatively loose ties by 
virtue of a highly flexible network infrastructure, rather than extensive legal 
arrangements and financial investments. 

49 


