
Dit. CRAVWFORD ON GOITtE.

TO THlE EDLTORS OF TUE MONTREAL MEDICAL GAZETTE.

GENTLEMEÑ,-Having observed in the I ti nunu>er of the Medlical
Oazette, " some reniarks on Bronchoceleer Goitt·e" which ybu have
transferred fromu the pages of the London and Edinburgh Medicdl Jour-
nal ; I take the liberty of noticing an assertion therein which I cou-
ceive is not supported by facts, and which'if permitted to occupy your
pagesunnoticed would be tacitly admitting its correctness and giving
it confirmation and authority. I allude to the statement that tisi
'unsiglitly disease" "lhas in consequence of the clearing of the woods,
entirely disappeared from certain partý,of Nortlh Anierica," where it
had previously greatly prevailed, upon which assertion the autior ba-
ses a novel opinion as to the origin or cause of tie malady. It vould
be a very unntecessary waste of ink and time, to teli you or your rea-
dérs, that our g- .d City and other populous towns and " clearances"
ofNorth America still exhibit very numerous and nggravated cases of
"the unseemly malady," and that many of these cases (even at the pre-
sent day,) originated in inmmigrants fron thp "Old World," aftei their
arrival here, who have from the first located in our Cities, and have
nèver exposed themselves to any of the more acknovIedged evils, of
the primaeval forest ; 1 therefore think the author nust look to oflher
causes before he-is likely to discover the unknown source of this nail-
dy, its-prevalence in " Merry England," on the sunmits of th e Alps,
or on the Hynalayha Mountains, as well as in Southern or Northern
Ameîica, refute the idea of its dependence on the damp and close at.
mosphere ofthe forest. I shall pass over tie fancied connection bé-
tveen Goitre and Rheumatism, which the author notices, as I have not

r emarked their asîo.iation. I would however take the liberty of noti-
cing a. rare circumstance which I met with about three years ago, viv:
a'case of congenital Goitre, only two cases of which I can ind où re-
cord. The patient was brought to me two days after birtii, in-conse-
queice of a considerable tumor on the front and sides of the neck,
occ.upying the situation of the -thyroid body, the hypertrophy still re-
mains' as nothing has been done for it, a tumoi f somewhàt similar
character-likewise arose on the mother's neck, during her puerpera
state, afew monds before lier accouchrient, wfhich I beliéve bas
wholly- or in great i. asure disappeared. I notice this rather exti-aoï-
dinary coincider-e, withoutin any way attempting to theorize, or spec-
ulate on these mysteries.

I am Gentlemen,
Your Obedient Servant,

J. 'CRAwFOn», M.p.
St. James Place, 17th Feb. 1845.

TO THE EDITORS OP TBE MONTREAL MEDICAL GAZ ËTTE.
Dar/>y-1Iouse,.Stamnford, C.. W. Feb. 5t.

GENTLEMEt,-I have.ûddressed the Honorable, the Attorney Gen
eral.Smith on the proposed Medical Bill, now before the Iouse, for
the purpose of entreating him to delay the passage of the Billuitihthe
next Session, when the sense of the profession can >b obtained, by
calling public meetings at Toronto, Kingston, and other large towns,


