
INTRODUCTION rs*
ir^N#Through the Program for 

Export Market Development 
(PEMD), External Affairs and 
International Trade Canada (EAITC) 
offers assistance to Canadian businesses to 
participate in or undertake various types of 
export promotion activities. PEMD 
covers projects initiated by both industry 
and government, and is designed to assist 
companies regardless of size. 
Government-initiated activities that are 
covered by PEMD are organized by 
EAITC and businesses are invited to 
participate in these events by the 
government. Another component of 
PEMD provides financial assistance for 
export marketing activities that are 
initiated by industry. This type of 
assistance, which is repayable if sales are 
generated, is administered by the 
International Trade Centres located in 
major cities across Canada. A list of these 
Centres appears at the end of the booklet.
This booklet has been produced to 
acquaint you with the Government- 
Initiated Trade Fairs Program in Western 
Europe. Events are selected annually 
based on degree of international advantage
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