
5708 COMMONS DEBATES December 12, 1980

Oral Questions

again, 1 want 10 rernind him of the very exceptional and
compounded difficulties which Canadians who livc in the
mid-Canada section, the northern part of the provinces and the
northern regions of Canada, are facing with respect to the high
cost of living and the energy package. We have situations
where people have to walk away from their homes. They
cannot afford to buy heating oul at $2 a gallon or to buy
gasoline which costs $3 and $5 a gallon in some areas of
northern Canada. Does the minister have any compassion for
these exceptional problems in Canada?! Is there any plan, sueh
as an energy tax credit or any kind of emiergency plan, which
the government is intending to implernent 10 mnitigate against
these very serious difficulties in the north?

Hon. Allan J. MacEachen (Deputy Prime Minister and
Minister of Finance): Madami Speaker, obviously the govern-
mrent is concerned about the impact of energy prices on
Canadians and, of course, on northern Canadians. It was
because of that concern that the government brought in a
prieing regime which placed a less onerous burden on Canadi-
an consumers than that put forward in the budget of my
predecessor.

Mr. Croshie: Rubbîsh. Tired excuse.

Mr. MacEachen: Again, the hon. miember has referrcd. as
have other spokesmen in the opposition, to an energy tax credit
and a mortgage tax deductibility program as solutions. 1
remind him that the imposition of the 18-cent tax on gasoline
n their budget, wliith is fresh in uur menmory because of the

annivcrsary date, would have virtually wiped out aIl the ben-
efits proposed in these progranis.

RI QI ST F OR IMRGC\Mi \Si.RiS TO Ri lit VL iIAR[SHiP

Mr. F. Oberle (Prince George-Peace River): Madami
Speaker, 1 should like to address my supplenientary question
to the Prime Minister, who seems 10 be very preoccupied these
days with the North-South dialogue. 1 wonder if he could
projeet himself t0 the North-South problems in our country. Is
he aware that there are small children and old people living in
the north swho are starving. who are dcprived in a way compa-
rable to Third World conditions, because of the harsh realities
of the economie situation in our country'! People of the north
cannot transport thcmisclves by way of a transit system. They
are restricted t0 the use of their cars or 10 aircraft. Most part
of the year is very cold, îhey must heat their homes and the
situation is desperate. Will the Prime Minister undertake, with
his cabinet, to attempt t0 work out a programi which will
addrcss itself t0 this rather serious emiergency situation in the
north?

Right Hon. P. E. Trudeau (Prime Minister): Madami
Speaker. 1 reeognize that life in the north entails many dif-
ficulties and even hardship. 1 have made several trips into the
north and have indeed tried to inîroduce policies and measures
which would alleviate some of those hardships. If anyone is
actually starving, as the hon. member suggests, I wish he

would communicate their names immediately 10 the govern-
mient s0 we could take emergency measures.

ENERGY

INQIiRY RISPF(TING CONTINGFNCY PLANS TO ASSIST
UNI MIILOYtI) Oit WEL I DRILLERS

Mr. Bill Wright (Calgary North): Madami Speaker, my
question is for the Ninister of Energy. Mines and Resources.
Canadian oil well drilling contractors reporîcd in Novemiber
that 120 drilling contracts had been cancelled and that 60
more rîgs wcre scheduled t0 ]cave the country. According to
the drilling conîractors, approximaîely 10,800 jobs will be lost
in western Canada. This information was provided to the
government one month ago. Could the minister tell the House
if he has any contingency plans t0 help these workers?

Hon. Marc Lalonde (Minister of Energy, Mines and
Resources): Madam Speaker, I have had a very fruitful meet-
ing this morning wiîh representatives of the drilling contrac-
tors association. During the discussions il became clear that
the best solution was an early agreement bctween the govern-
mient of Alberta and the Governmnent of Canada. The drilling
contractors recognize this requires the willîngness of both
governmients t0 sit down, negotiate and compromise. Thcy
indicaîed they would make similar representations to the
governmient of Alberta in order to arrive at an early
agreement.

Mr. Wright: Madamn Speaker. I amn sure ail these workers
will like the minister's answer. In addition t0 the 10,800
workers who will be out of work this spring in western Canada,
there are many workers in central Canada who also will be out
of work. Could the minister tell us how many workers wîll be
affected in Ontario and what plans he has 10 help these
workers?

Mr. Lalonde: I have to remind the hon. member that the
best solution is one whereby an agreement will be reached that
would be fair t0 the Canadian public in general as weil as 10
the industry. I have t0 remind the hon. meniber that every
dollar increase in the prîce of oil mecans that Canada loses
20,000 jobs; that is, 20.000 more unemploycd, on a net basîs,
result from this increase in the price of oil. This is bascd on
figures provided by OECD which apply to aIl other indlustrial-
ized counîries. We sec the results in the western world of the
impact of' high increases in the price of oil which have now
taken place together with a tremendous increase in uncmploy-
mient in the whole indusîrializcd world, whether il k in
Europe, in the United States or in Canada. One has t0 bear in
mind those factors. The price of oil cannot be increased very
much wiîhout having a negative impact, both in terms of
inflation and in îerms of unemploymenî, and I invite my
friends t0 refleet on that also. That is why we are Irving 10

arrive ai an agreement which will provide for fair prices 10
Canadians, as the budget did ai the end of October.
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