
8. When any person has ceased to hold a commission, he
shall be liable to perform militia service in the ranks in the
reserve or in the first class, according to his age.

9. The militia in each county shall be formed into regiments,
the regiments shall be divided into companies, and the compa-
nies shall be divided into squads.

10. Regimental districts shall be determined by the lieute-
nant-colonels in each county; companies divisions by the
lieutenant-colonel of and captain in each regiment, and squad
divisions by captains of companies-all subject to the orders
and approval of the Commander-in-chief.

11. The Commander-in-chief shall appoint commissioned
officers, adjutants, and commissioned regimental staff, and
make regulations for their attendance at drill and their exami-
nation for appointment and promotion. Any oflfier neglecting
his duty, and failing to give satisfactory reasons for such neglect
when called upon, may be deprived of his commission by the
Commander-in-chief, or at the option of such officer, be brought
before a court martial for trial. Militia regiments failing to
organize or train, may be called ont for muster or training
under officers or non-commissioned officers of contiguous or
other districts, at the discretion of the Commander-in-chief ;.
and the officers so employed shall be paid four dollars aday,.
and non-commissioned officers two dollars-to be levied by
assessment on the regimental district.

12. Adjutants shall be divided into first and second class,,
the latter to be designated acting Adjutants, and the former
Adjutants.

13. Adjutants shall be entitled to receive forty dollars per
annum, and acting Adjulants twenty dollars, to be drawn froim
the Provincial Treasury on certificate froin the commanding,
officers of regiments, to which Adjutants of either class are
attached, that they have faithfully performed hIe respective
duties required of them ; but no Adjutant shall receive any pay
or allowances until he is certified by the Adjutant-General of
Militia, that all the returns of his regiment are in up to date,
and Adjutants behind hand in periodical returns shall forfeit,
their pay for the year unless otherwise ordered by the Com-
mander-in-chief.

14. Under the orders of their commanding officers, Adjutants
shall attend to field duties, the enrolment and organization of
their regiments and such correspondence and returns as they
may be commanded to conduct.

15. Acting Adjutants shall attend to the acquirement of field,
duties on opportunity being afforded them, and shall conduct,
all the other duties required from adjutants, until qualified as
field adjutants, when they rank as first class on approval.

16. The Lieutenant-Colonels may appoint acting adjutantis.
17. No acting adjutants, not being qualified, shall standg

the way of the promotion to the first class adjutancy ,of any
officer who is qualified and willing to lake the duiv, and adju-
tants of etither class may, on the report of an mnspecting 'field


