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the boundary case determined only the
question of the boundaries of Ontario, but
nothing as to the ownership and control of
lands within those boundaries. "Lands re-
served for Indians" are vested, by the B.N.
A. Act, in the Dominion, and the case has
largely turned upon a construction of these
words,-whether they are broad enough in
meaning to cover such lands as these in
question, occupied by Indians and never
surrendered to the Crown, or mean only
these particular tracts of land which have
been specially set apart, throughout the
Dominion, for the use of particular tribes.

On the 10th June, 1885, the Chancellor
of Ontario, in a very learned judgment,
granted the injunction asked for by the pro-
vince, deciding that the Indians never had
any legal right to the soil which the Crown
is bound to recognize; that where they
have been, from time to time, dealt with in-
treaties by the British Government or the
Canadian Government, this has been done
from motives of benevolence, pity and phil-
antrophy, and not from any consideration
of any legal rights existing in the Indians,
and required to be recognized and formally
dealt with; that the words "lands reserved
for Indians," in the B.N.A. Act, cannot be
given the broad interpretation asked by the
defendant company, and cannot be con-
strued as covering the lands in question;
that these lands are part of the property of
the Province of Ontario, as "public lands ;"
and consequently the Dominion Govern-
ment had no right to grant the timber
license in question to the St. Catharines
company, that that license was a nullity,
and the province was entitled to an injunc-
tion to restrain the company from acting
under it. And this decision was, on appeal,
unanimously sustained by the Court of Ap-
peal for Ontario.

The case was then carried to the Supreme
Court, where it was argued during last No-
vember for several days. Judgment was
given recently, affirming the judgment of
the courts below in favor of the province,
and in support of the injunction therein
granted. Here, however, the Court was
not un4nimous. Strong and Gwynne, J.J.,
gave strongly dissenting judgments, taking
the common ground that the Indians have
a legal right in the soil occupied by them
until it is surrendered to the Crown; that
this right has been guaranteed to them by
the Proclamation of 1763, and by the
whole course of governmental dealing since;
that the lands in question were "lands re-
served for Indians" under the correct and
liberal meaning of that term, and so be-
longed to the Dominion, subject to the
rights of the Indians; that those rights
were surrendered by the treaty of 1878, and
the Dominion Government were thus made
owners of the lands, and atone entitled to
deal with them as they had done in the
granting of the St. Catharines company's
license.

The company has obtained from the
Privy Council leave to appeal to that final
tribunal, where the case will soon come on
for argument; and, with the division of
opinion so markedly shown in the Supreme
Court, it will be understood that this final
settlement of the principles above pointed
eut, which are involved in the de'cision, will
be looked forward to with great interest,
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