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since 1920-21; statement that tax re-
ductien is equivalent to additional
taxation; pyramiding of sales tax
under Conservative administration,;
reduction of incorne tax wit~h reduc-
tion of debt, 1272; reduction of taxes
on receipts, cheques and postage,
1922-28, 1273; increases and reduc-
tions in sales tax 1921-28j 1273-4;
sales tax by 'budget years; exemp-
tions, 1275-6; sales tax 8houqd be
removed by degrees; refund to auto-
mobile dealers; absorption of tax in
reductions by stages; income tax; ex-
emptions, 1922-28, 1277; reductions in
individual incarne tax, 1927-28; collec-
tion of equivalent or greater arnount
with lowering pf rate of taxation,
1278; revenue collected under incorne
tax, individuals and corporations,
1918 te 1928; reductions in corpora-
tion income tax, 1922-28, 1279; rea-
sons for reducing income tax; do-
mainion-provincial conference and in-
corne tax; delimitations of fields of
taxation; income taxes imposed by
provinces and municipalities; federal
government should collect corpora-
tion income tax, 1280; provinces re-
stricted te direct taxation; suggested
collection of income tax by dominion
governnment and distribution amongst
provinces; maintenance of individual
incomne tax; reduction of custom.s
duties under Liberal administration,
1281; Conserva tive party and protec-
tion, 1282; protection appeals directed
te individual localities; opposition
-avoid dividling house on su'bject of
protection; gen.eral election of 1921;
(Jonservative amendmnents to the bud-
get since 1922; tariff advisory board and
tariff revision; Conservative party and
protection for special interests; chair-
man of the tarifi advisory board,
1283; Sir Thornas White and the
Grand Trunk Railway board of ar-
bitration, 1284; Sir Henry Drayton
and Conservative tariff commission,
1285; Mr. Manion and Ontario Liquor
Commission; functions of the tariff
advisory board, 1286; power of tax-
ation rests in House cd Commons;
budget tariff changes; cotton and
woollen industries; reduction -of
duties on cotton textiles; tariff re-
ductions on cotton and woollen goods

King, Right Hon. W. L. Mackenzie-Con.
Budget-Con.

prier to and under budget, 1287;
British preference, requirement of
British material or labour content;
coarser cotton goods, 1288; govern-
ment's rnethod of tariff revision; in-
terparliamentary conference of 1927
and the tariff; farm iniplement in-
dustry; opposition quotatioins from
American sources; Massey-Harris
Comnpany on condition of implement
industry; employment ini implement
industry, 1289; Mr. Bennett's state-
ment as te econornic dependence on
foreigners, 1289; employment in in-
dustry; index numbers fer 1921-27;
immigration, 1290; Canadians re-
turning f rom. United States; emi-
gration te United States, 1291; Cana-
dians crossing the line; immigration
frorn United States to Canada; Cana-
dian and Newfoundland-born resi-
dents in United States, 1292; immî-
grants entering Canada frorn other
countries increasing; trade between
Australia and Canada; Vancouver
and growth of Pacifie trade; develop-
ment of natural resources; value of
Canadian ficld crops; pulp and paper
production, mineraIs, fisheries, manu-
factures, 1293; statement as to "part-
ing with our estate"; total arable
land of Canada; agriculture and de-
velopment in trade; Canada's timber
area; co-operation with provinces in
saving the forestsý; losses by insects
and .pests; extent of mineral wealth
of Canada; conservation and increase
of fisheries; hydro-electrie power;
scientiflc development 0f natural re-
sources, 1294; excess of imnports over
experts of raw material; effect of use
of entire wheat crop for Canadian
fleur milîs; statements as to defeat
of Liberal government in 1926; pro-
ceedings of Jonc 25, 1920, 1295; dis-
solution , n 1926; goveroment in office
by vote of people and confidence of
the house; "phantorn" administra-
tion of 1926; Miss Macphail and pro-
cedure in the House of Commons;
right of Prime Minister te request
dissolution; will of majority in par-
liamnent expressed through cabinet
and Prime Mdnister; comparison be-
tween Canadian and United States
legisîstive systems; executive inde-
pendence of legislature in flxed termn
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