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Unemploymen t Insurance

Mr. Kemnpling: Do flot play with words.
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Mr. Stollery: In fact, the contributor once he cornes back
to Canada, is perfectly witbin his rigbt to file a dlaim.

Mr. Kernpling: Af ter eight weeks. You did flot listen to
what I said.

Mr. Stollery: 1 arn reading the part of the motion whjch
says that he cannot receive benef its f rorn bis contributions
upon returning to Canada. I arn pointing out to the hon.
member that as I understand it, a person wbo cornes back
to Canada after a period abroad can in fact dlaim unern
ployment insurance.

Mr. Kemnpling: No. Check with the Unemployrnent
Insurance Commission.;

Mr. Stollery: Persons who return to Canada upon
becorning unemployed, or who become unemployed upon
their returfi to Canada, are covered by the contributions
made when outside the country. I must say 1 fail to
understand the point in respect of the woman who went
overseas and wbo seemed to be concerned because she did
not receive a refund of ber unemployment insurance
payment.

Mr. Kemnpling: That is not it at ail.

Mr. Stollery: A major reason for establishing universal
coverage in the act was to ensure that ail persons working
in insurable employment, wbether inside or outside
Canada, would benefit from the program. If the hon.
member would do his research, 1 think that is what he
would find. But I should like to explain another important
area wbere contributors under the act wilI receive benefit
outside Canada. That is in relation to the recîprocal
arrangements whicb Canada has with the United States. I
would direct the attention of the hon. member to those
arrangements. Section 12 of the Unempînyment Insurance
Act grants authority to the commission to establish agree-
ments wjth other countries. Part of this section reads as
f ollows:

With the approval of the governor in council, the commission
may. notwîthstanding any other provision of this aci, enter loto

agreements with the governmients of other countries to establish

reciprocal arrangements on matters relatîng to unempioyment

insurancC.

Sections 34 and 37 of the Unemployment Insurance Act
stipulate tbat recîpients of unemployment insurance bene-
fits wbo do not resîde in Canada are not entîtled to those
benefits wbicb are determined by national and regional
unemployment rates. Tbey are entitled specifically to
benefits accrued by virtue of the length of their labour
force attacbment. As the hon. member knows, Canada is
divided into areas, and if those figures go te, over 4 per
cent the rate of unernploynient insurance alters. It is very
clearly pointed out that people wbo are subject to the
reciprocal -arrangements tbat Canada bas, specifically
wîth the United States, are entitled te benefits accruing by
vîrtue of their labour force attachînent. At the presenit
time Canada has reciprocal arrangements witb the United
States in matters of unemployment insurance.

Mr. Kernpling: What about Germany?
[Mr. Stollery.]

Mr. Stollery: The Canadian-Amerîcan reciprocal agree-
ment is an administrative arrangement wbereby the
Arnerican states, Puerto Rico, the District of Columnbia,
and Canada-I will get to Gerrnany in a moment, if the
bon. member wilI be patient-take eacb otber's claims on
interstate forrns hut payments to clairnants are made by
the liable state or country authority, that is, the place
where the claimant acquîred bis unemployment insurance
credîts pays bîrn bis benefits under the terms of its act
wbicb governs unemployment insurance. The place where
the claimant resides while claimirig beniefits ensures hîs
availabilîty for employment and miay recommend bis dis-
qualification to the hiable state if, in their opinion, the
claîmant is not meeting the provisions of the act whicb
would determîne bis benefits. Benefits, then, are paîd by
the country wbere tbe credît was establisbed, and not by
the country in wbîcb the elaimant is seekîng ernployment.
The volume of traffîc betwcen Canada and the UJnited
States is about equal-I think this refers specîfîcally to
what the bon. inember was suggesting about Germany-
and therefore the time and cost of administration is also
about equal.

There is another circumrstance in whicb a ('anadian
claimant in a foreigo country is covered by the unienploy-
ment insurance scheme, that is, if he falîs sick iii a foreign
country, the regulations state that his perîod of actual
bospitalization in a foreign country is covered by the
Canadian unerrployment însurance program. 1 should lîke
to deal for a moment with the coverage provis:ons of the
present act and the relationsbip of those provisions to
persons employed outsîdc this country. The provisions of
section 52 of the legisiation are a carry-over of ihe nid act
and read as follows:

The umployrnent of a person outside Canada. other than a

person empioycd on a ship or vesse] as described in sction 51, is

included in insol able emplyment xvhere that person:

(a) normallv y esides in Canada.

(b) is employed outside Canada or partly outside Canada by an

employer wlîo is a resident or has a place of business in Canada.

and

(c) wouid be crnployed in insurable eroiynierît if suchi emîpioy-

ment were in Canada, and

(d ) îs not employed in emplnyment thai is jîraurable undur the

laws of the country in which he is employed.

The impact of section 52 was greatly increased by the
provision of the new act whîch, because cf the universal
nature of coverage, included members of the Canadian
armed forces and the public service. 1 arn sure we remem-
ber the protests of a fcw years ago when thîs universal
aspect was being considered by, for example, people in the
nursing profession who foît they should net bave te pay
unemployment insurance and who now, I think, are con-
tent te pay because, cf course, if they becorne unemployed
they are elîgîble,
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When you consîder the varieus alternatives relating te
payments to Canadians nbroad, there are a number of
solutions wbicb are possible that would continue the uni-
versal coverage cf the program as well as allow us te pay
benefits te thiese whu are contributîng under the' aci wsher-
ever tbey rnay be. The following are a few possibîiliies.
First, we could enter ioto r'eciprocal agreemnents wtîahl
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