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neyer allows thie admiration whichlibe
may feel for the man be describes to
overpower bis judgrnent or obscure
bis faculties. H1e delicately refers to
bis wvomk as nîerely the resuit of the
labours of the picture-cleaner, and
says witli reference to some cases tbat
bis duty '18i not so mucli to paint a
new picture as to make one that bas
been already painted more clearly
visible, liv removing wbat obscures it,
whilst reverently especting, and care-
fully preserving those delicacies of
tone and detail, those thin glazes of
transparent and semi-transparent
colour, on which botb its beauty and
its truth depend. This is not to be
done by scraping down to the bare
canvas, and it is not to be doue by
daubing additions; liut itmay be ac-
complisbed by mnetliod and patience,
unite(l to watcliful care.'

Iu this amiable spirit, Mr. Ham-
nierton proceed s to sketcli in bis ar-
tistic and splendid way the lives of the
eminent traveller and naturaliet, Vic-
tor Jacquemont; Henri iPermeyve, the
pure-minded ecclesiastic and orator;
François Rude, the greatest cliaracter
in the book and a scuiptor of magni-
ficent genius; Jean Jacques Ampère,
the bistorian and traveller ; and Henri
Regnault, wbose skill as a painter bas
been compared to tbat of Eugène De-
lacroix, and whose lofty patriotismn
liolds no second place amoug the pat-
riots of the world.

Mn. Hammemton's materials con-
sist for tbe most part of letters,
though inl instances wbere these are
wantlug, notably in tlie case of Rude,
lie lias lieen aided by accounts fur-
nislied by near friends of the suliject.
lis narratives may be accepted as ac-
curate, for lie lias been caneful to sift
and verify evemy detail contaiued lu
tbem. The story is most deligbtfully
written. Every page is distluguisbed
for its grace and symmetny aud lieauty.
The anecdotes are told spiritedly and
well, and the incidents and description
are admiralile. Mr. ilammerton bluta
in bis iPreface of other lives among

bis littie list of eminent Modern
Frenchmen which lie would like to
write. We hope lie will not ]ose siglit
of this idea. A supplementary volume
would lie gratefntlly received liy the
admirers of scholarly and astute hio-
graphy.

Scholars and students of English
literature everywhere will tbank Mr.
Matthew Arnold for bis edition of
Johnson's Lives of the iPoets.'* In

an article in one of the magazines
some months ago, Mr. Arnold alluded
to the great value such a work as the

hoe under notice would prove, and

1 rpryqualified,would undertaketh
issueof helibope. tNosnonemn

forward, Mm. Arnold bas himself
taken up the task, and the volume he
has given us shows how admiralily lie
lias carried out bis original idea. It
is well known that Jolinson's Lives
are of unequal merit. Tbey were
written for the booksellems in the great

iautbor's ' usual way, unwilling to
work, and working wýith vigour and
baste.' But for ahl that tbey stand as
Byron lias said, 'the fiuest critical
work extaiit.' In the shape in wbich
the public have been in the habit of
gettiug, tbem, in the best four-volume
edition, or in the vemy good single-vol-

i urne copy whicli is accornpanied by
Scott's Memoir, the book lias proved
most inconvenient for text-book pur-
poses. There is mucli that is botb
insignificant and unnecessary. And
as the editor of the edition before
us says, ' Tbe volumes at present
are a work to stand iu a library, "la
work whicli no gentleman's library
sbould lie witliout." ' Few are ac-
quainted, therefore, witb this splendid
work-a work which Scott declared
displayed qualifications wbicb bave

seldom been coucentrated to the samne
degree in any literary undertaking,'
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