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W. H. Stcelc, James Stirton, Guelph; A. F. Webster, C.
Wettlauffer, London; W. E. Willmott, W. Wilson, W. M. Worden,
Toronto; H. T. Wood.

Dr. T. J. Joncs, of Victoria, B.C., an old Ontario boy, paid us a
visit in Montreal, en route to the Old Country, some months ago,
and rcturncd in tine for the Congrcss. The doctor is a walking
advertisenent for our magnificent province on the Pacific.

Dr. George Hutchison, of Ottawa, was in Montrcal fora Saturday
holiday, to wvitness the lacrosse match betwccn the Capitals and
Shamrocks. George has a wooden leg, of which lie is a bit proud.
When a mere kid, a lot of us hcard there was likely to be a row at
the tinc Rcv. Father Gavazzi preachcd in Zion Church, Montreal.
Of course wc had to go and sec it. The 26th Regiment was in
the city, and by the stupidity of the mayor, who was in charge as
chief magistratc, they flred a vollcy of ball cartridge at the mob.
We remember the whistling of the bul'ts and the thud of then
into a strcct close to where wc stood, only about ten yards from
George. We saw Geordie fall. Tiat was our flrst introduction to
hin. Amputation of one lcg above the knee was necessary. We
have lad a lot of fun out of the substitute. He goes up and down
stairs five or six steps at a hop ; he was goal-keeper of the Ottawa
Lacrosse Club for many years, and that stump stopped as many
balls as his lacrosse stick. As a curler he is a signal success, and
the stump enjoys it innensely. As a rifle shot, it steadies him
like a rock. We believe, on a pinch, he could use it as a plugger
or an elcvator. If cver lie turns fariner, it will come in " handy"
in planting potatoes. If lie got nad at Sullivan or Corbett, lie
would have their heads off with it before they could say Jack
Robinson. Wien he dies, the stump will go to soine museum in
Ottawa as an object-lcsson to young men in overcoming dis.
advantages. We would fear for our own scalp were it not
that his good-nature is proverbial.

Dr. Frank Ibbotson, of Montreal, one of our bright and promis-
ing young dentists, lias located in Edmonton. Dr. E. B. Ibbotson
visited the North-West with his brother, and was charmed with
the country and its prospects. We ask for our young confrere a
kindly welcome.

Our good friend, Dr. C. N. Johnson, formerly of Toronto, now
of Chicago, was one of the nost active of the of'fcers at the Con-
gress. Dr. Johnson not only holds one of the most important
professional appointments in the Chicago College of Dental
Surgery, but lie is one of the active editors of the Dental Review,
so ably conducted by Dr. A. W. Harlan, editor-in-chief. Canadian
dentistry is proud of Dr. Johnson, who, while not forgetting his
native land, does his duty faithfully as a citizen and a teacher in
the land of his adoption.
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