
TUh Cross.

On thie Feait of the Sacred Ileart of
Jesus.

This festival is celebrated by the
church on the Friday after thc octave
,of Corpus Christi; and the lb-st.Friday
of each month ;i the year is kept as a
day of particular devnticî by the mein-
bers of the Association of the Sacred
H-eart. Perhaps, the history of the
clhurch does flot furnishi an instance in
which any devotion was so rapidly ex-
tended throughout the Christian wvorld,1
or so eagerly embraced by nunicrous
bodies of the faithfui, as this. It en-
countered, for a fong time, great oppo-
sition, both from. those who understood
and those whio were ignorant of its na-!
ture. The former allegcd, that it tend-
eci t superstition, whilst many of the
latter considered it wholly unlawful and
unauthorised. But it is, at tlie present
day, triuimph antly vin dieated by the so-
lemn and formnai sanction of the Hiolyl
See, and the approbation of every part
af the Catholie lUhureh. At the saine
tume, it may be useful to state, in a fcw'
words, the nature and objeets of this
inuchi misrepresented devotion, as ivel
as ta notice a fcw of the objections'
which have been urged against it.These
wvill be much better understood, by pre-
rnising some principles of faith on w'hich
ail Catholies mnust necessarily agree.-
The Catholie Clîurch, then, teac hes~
ilhat there are two natures-the divine
and hunian-in the one adorable person
of our Redeenier, Uic God-rnan, Christ
Jesus, the second person ai the adora-
bic Trinity; that those two natures areI
united in liii without being con-
Çounded ; that this union is mysteri-
ans, inexplicable, and incoînprehensi-
.le with regard to the manner iii which

it takes pla&e ; that this uniion of the di-

vin ity exists in ail and every part of the
hurnan fraine and human nature of'
Christ ; so that, for instance, the re is
not the smallest part of bis sacred body
which, does not contain ail bis divine
and hurnan nature. It is also of faith,
that the clivinity aî,d humnanity do not
separately but unitedly exist in the per-
soli of Christ, and that neif ber the one
nor the other 3xclusively exists in -ny
part of bis gloriaus person, tie union of'
the two natures being a real indissolu-
bie and eternal union. According,
therefore, ta the rigid canons of faith,
no one part of the sacred liumanity o.'
Christ (thus united to bis divinity) is
more worthy of adoration and love than,
another, the divinity being in the 'whole
and every part of the human nature.-
The band oi the foot, ihe head or the
sacred licart, possesses in itself
no exclusive titie to our gratitude or
lioniage. Nevertlieless, at the sarne time~
we înay separateiy consider thein iii pi-
ans meditation; and they may separately
excite various affections of divine love.
The head of Christ cî.owrned with
'thorns, and bieeding for our sins, his
hands tied ta thc piliar, bis feet nailed
to the cross, his side pierced with a
spear, bis begart bui'ning with love, may
eaehi furnishi salutary subjeets of reflec,
tion ta the understanding, and power-
fui motives of love ta the heart of man,
Though ecd is equaiiy worthy of ado-
ration froîn iis union ivith ilhe divinity,
yet our hearts anC ininds Nvill somxe-
tumes be more powverfully affected by
the contemplation of one than that of
thc other. According to our human
notions and forms of expression, the
heart is said to be the seat of the affec-
tions. We suppose that the soul ope-.
rates principally or. the heart ; and we
thus ascribe to the heart, in a figurtive
sense,the varions feelingge aid. 2o¶ýof#


