
May 1, 985COMMONS DEBATES 49

office "in their new subdivision. This is the second petition
concerning the Iack of postai service in as many days.

DIVORCE ACT

MEASURE TO AMEND

Hon. John C. Crosbie (Minister of Justice and Attorney
General of Canada) moved for leave to introduce Bill C-46, an
Act to amend the Divorce Act.

Mr. Speaker: Is it tbe pleasure of tbe House that the Hon.
Minister shaii have leave to introduce the Bill?

Sonie Hon. Members: Agreed.

Motion agreed to, Bill read the first time and ordered to be
printed.

DIVORCE AND COROLLARY RELIEF ACF

MEASURE TO ENACT

Jnvestment Canada Act

QUESTIONS ON THE ORDER PAPER

(Questions answered oraily are indicated by an asterisk.)

Mr. Paul Dick (Parliamentary Secretary to President of
the Privy Council): Mr. Speaker, 1 wouid ask that ail ques-
tions be ailowed to stand.

Mr. Speaker: Shall ail remaining questions be allowed to
stand?

Somne Hon. Members: Agreed.

MOTIONS FOR PAPERS

Mr. Speaker: Shall ail Notices of Motions for the Produc-
tion of Papers be allowed to stand?

Sonie Hon. Members: Agreed.

Hon. John C. Croshie (Minister of Justice and Attorney
General of Canada) moved for leave to introduce Bill C-47, an
Act respecting divorce and coroliary relief.

Mr. Speaker: Is it the pleasure of the House that the Hon.
Minister shah bhave leave to introduce the Bill?

Some Hon. Members: Agreed.
Motion agreed to, Bill read tbe first time and ordered to be

printed.

FAMILY ORDERS ENFORCEMENT ASSISTANCE ACT

MEASURE TO ENACT

Hon. John C. Crosbie (Minister of Justice and Attorney
General of Canada) moved for icave to introduce Bill C-48, an
Act to provide for the release of information that may assist in
iocating defaultîng spouses and other persons and to permit,
for the enforcement of support orders and support provisions,
the garnishment and the attacbment of certain moncys pay-
able by Her Majesty in rigbt of Canada.

Mr. Speaker: Is it tbe picasure of the House that the Hon.
Minister shaîl bave leave to introduce the Bill?

Somne Hon. Members: Agreed.

Motion agreed to, Bill read the first time and ordered to be
printed.

GOVERNMENT ORDERS

[Translation]

INVESTMENT CANADA ACT

MEASURE TO ENACT

Tbe House resumed consideration of Bill C-1i5, an Act
respecting investment in Canada, as reported (witb amend-
ments) from the Standing Committee on Regional Develop-
ment; and Motions Nos. 8, 12, 32, 63, 69, 74 and 75 (Mr.
Langdon) (p. 4242).

Mr. Fernand Robichaud (Westmnorland-Kent): Mr. Speaker,
1 bad a few minutes left yesterday wben the Flouse was
debating the Bill, and particulariy the amendments. i was
saying how important empioyment is back home and that we
must ensure that this Bill and these amendments do protect
our jobs. 1 was referring to recent riots in our region because
people thought or expected that their jobs would be taken
away from them. Why riots? Quite simpiy because there had
been no consultation, because the people, the contractors had
failed to talk to the workers and discuss the issue with them.
Unions and workers were cornered and it was indeed the only
means left to them to protest against disappearing jobs.
Because machinery was taking jobs away from manual labour,
those people reacted violently. 1 can tell the House that with
2,OOO-odd people invoived, it was not a pretty sight.

Weil, Mr. Speaker, that is something we might witness
again if the Flouse rejects the proposed amendments, with the
result that new companies setting up sbop in our regions might
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