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the corn was moving although there was 
no wind. The raccoons were promptly 
hunted out ; and one of the young ones, 
before they could gain the shadowy 
refuge of the trees, was killed with 
sticks, — the setter contributing much 
noise, but keeping at a very safe dis­
tance. When the affray was over, and 
the young farmer, going through the 
field, found out what damage had been 
done, he was eloquent with picturesque 
backwoods blasphemies, and vowed the 
extermination of the whole coon clan. 
With the aid of the setter, who now, for 
the first time, was able to prove the 
worth of his breeding, he tracked the 
escaping marauders through the woods, 
and at last, after a long hunt, located 
their lair in the old sycamore-tree on the 
hill. At this his wrath gave way to 
the hunter’s elation. His eyes sparkled.

“To-morrow night,” said he, to the


