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PORTABLE BOR.
[No MACHINE.

We ilustrato on
thits page a portable

boring il a v h i nt
constructed for the

D e 1 a r t n e l t ofe
i)ocks inu New
York, and t desigdel
by Mr. Isaat New-

tonl, assistanit enig¡.
nieer. It lias be n

eutpIoyed for the

purpose of mîakiig
borings alintg tt'
water front of Mat.
Iattan Istland, iln
order to ittermiie
thle position and

gen eral chara<:tet
of the bed to, k.

T drills were in
ail casest drivei fat
tenontgh to atste rtin î

thlat it was the rock
itrelf, antd not boul-
iers iietely, that

hadl been reached.
lThe deslign of the

mabitine wil be
clearly understd t

fromî th engravi nig,
ini whlich it will he r

tetn that the.t fraTni-
ing is of the lighit-
est forn ibbt

and that it cati te,
e-asily takenI apart

and reerettd. It

wNasl fou nd nære t
conlvenint ti dlle

etstil y shift ed appa t;c
tati-. The tilit

req 1utrel to t a k t»

anti to pack it itto

a truck for renoval,
is forty miiit-s'.

The meansri, pro)v:-
ded ftr wtrk it
thc e brinig r! te

constists, a will be

se-n, tf a rop- tt-

taclited tx,'ai e -ln-

tric (en thedvwhel
of t I e # t a I-
work'd winch, anti
wic- h patssige o

a lell.v runlnin 4
i n a bracket on ti,.
fraimle, if : re -
the w e i g I t atit

coulitilng rol, t,
whl~ichl the rto- en a
rying the! botrinig
tooi is fa.te.tned. In
addition to this th'.
i a c h i I e tait bet

îited as a Itie-tlrî.
ver, or for sitkittg
tiituest to serve aï-

litijigs for artesiant
welit ii this caset.
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PORTABL. BORINsG MACHINE, tFOr THE DEPARTMENT OF DOCKS, NEW YORK

D csc-tt av Mr. i e'..Fî Nc-wros. AsSITitT ENotNER.

the boring gear ia
removed, and the
drop weight shown
at the top of the
machine is em-
ployed.

The apparatus
has been in full and
suc'cesstful use for
more than a year,
and reflects rimuch
credit on its i.
'.gne*r
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k , Fa the "a t
. itrtrii(L!j

'lhe t inp rut , v
eiits ini railroad

rails, which we thir,
weck lillustrate, are
deAgned to gi ve tto
the rail that degree
of elasticity which
will enable it to
bear all the pres
sure and shock.s t'
which it may h,
siubjected lwith Il]b?
least 1p 0 r, - i b 1 ,
amocunt of wearand
tear to itcelf and
the rollitng tock
whih passe over
it. To. effect thi,s
luinch tghe desiredç

bjcteiniven-
tor relies ut) th,

nerits of the forix
and construction i
his rail, the mate-
rial of 'vhich it i,
mati, and his lite-
thod of Joinmng the
e n d s of adjacent
lengthis. Several
designs for the rail
are shown in out
eng ravingr, wlire

generally, A is tht
rail andI B the uou-

ne tiig piece, al
of which are so-

cured by let t e r.,
patent.

The first patent
gruited to the i-

ventor, Mnr. Ruus
S. Santtorn, of

fRoc kford, Ill., da-
ted August 8, 1 S-.
was for the rail and
joint shown inFigs.
1 and 2. It will be
Steen that th! rail is
tubilar, the ipper
part being iearly
cylindrical and the

ichaer amewh t of
a triangular figure.
Thle nateriai of
Nwhich it l; forma i

CANFIELVS RIAILROAD CAR BRAKE.

1

MANUR SRAILROAD RAIL.


