
it will send its representatives out into 
every part of this land, and into all 
other lands as the ambassadors of 
Christ and messengers of Ilis grace. It 
makes itself the centre of all the work 
done for the good of the community. 
Every other benevolent, moral and re­
ligious enterprise looks to tho Church 
as the source of its strength. The spirit 
which the church generates will mani­
fest itself in meeting the higher needs 
of men in whatever form they may 
appear.
The Extent of the Work.

The extent of this work is enormous. 
This year we are supporting 768 Home 
Mission fields and 246 augumented 
charges. Co-operation with the Metho­
dists and Congregationalists guarantees 
that the above represents not more than 
half of the actual mission work done 
by the bodies which soon will form the 
United Church of Canada.
Masses in the Cities.

This is only part of our problem. 
There are masses in the cities to whom 
the ordinary methods of church work 
do not appeal. We arc seeking to reach 
these by our social settlements, and in 
Montreal, Toronto and Winnipeg we 
have flourishing institutions of this 
class ,and expect to have them estab­
lished in every congested centre in
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