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'ATTENTION.'
c PRESENT FIRELOCKS,'

by feizing the firelock with the left
hand at the fwell, the right hand
fhifted, and both holding the fire-
lock in the pofition of PRESENTED
ARMS.

' SHOULDER FIRELOCKS.'
PRIME AND LOAD WITI

BLANK CARTRIDGE, AND
SHOULDER.

FIRE THREE VOLLIES IN THE
AIR.

'ORDER ARMS.'
'FIX BAYONETS.'
'SHOULDER ARMS.'

'REAR RANKS TAKE CLOSE
ORDER.'

Wheel backwards by divifions on
the left, and march to camp or bar-
racks, the riglit in front, quick time,

In marching back the mufic are
not to play, or the drums to beat,
until the party is entirely clear of
the burying ground.

N. B. In the funerals of General
Ofricers, the arrangement of the pre-
fcribed number of pieces of cannon,
and of the different troops, muft be
made under the fuperintendance of
the general officer commanding the
whole, and muft neceffarily depend
on local circumfances.
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